

## UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO.

Report End Date: 3/15/2016 Report Number: 1 Rig: INTEGRITY, 3 Projected Days (days): 0 Drilling Days: End MD (ftKB): 0 Depth Progress (ft): Planned VS (ft): Current VS (ft): AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0			Surface Le UNIVERS 10, SECT	egal Location ITY LANDS SU 6	JRVEY, A-U212, BL	OCK	Latitude 31.2874000000		Orig KB EI	RKB (ft)	County REAGAN		S	state EXAS	
	ort Sur	nmary		Γotal D	epth Date		Rig Release Date	e	Target Fo	rmation				Propo	osed TD (ftKB)		
Status	at Repor	t Time							WFMPD_4	410_SH							
Operati	NTEGRIT	nmary FY 3 RIG								Planned Operations DRILL TO 721FT.							
SPOKE	TO KAY			6 AT 23		NUMBER PEN	IDING.			DIVILLE TO TEN T.							
	D (ftKB)				End M	ID (ftKB)		0	epth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	e (hr)		Av	g ROP (ft/hr)		
Time Start	End	Dur	Start Dep	th En	d Depth												
Time 15:00	Time 05:00	(hr) 14.00	(ftKB)	61	(ftKB) 61	MIRU INTEGR	ITY 3.	Cor	mments		Hole Sec	ion Interval	Categor	у	Activity RIG UP/RIG DOWN		NPT



## UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO.

Report End Date: 3/16/2016 Report Number: 3 Rig: INTEGRITY, 3 Projected Days (days): 0 Drilling Days: End MD (ftKB): 728 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): Current VS (ft): AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0				RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI Rk 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
	ud Date			al Depth Date	Э	Rig Release Date	Target Fo				F	Proposed TD (ftKB)	
	at Repor		NG ON BIG F	RIG.		1	WFMPD_	410_SH					
Operati PUMPE	ons Sum	nmary FACE CE			, RDMO CEMEN	NTERS, CUT OFF CAS	SING, RELEASED	Planned Operations WAIT ON BIG RIG.					
	16/16 08 D (ftKB)	3:00.		End N	MD (ftKB)	728	Depth Progress (ft)	<u> </u>	Drilling Time (hi	7)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
Time			0:			720			1				
Start Time 05:00	End Time 07:30	Dur (hr) 2.50	Start Depth (ftKB) 728	(ftKB)	R/U CREST CE	( MENT HEAD. TESTE	Comments OLINES TO 2500psi/5r	min	Hole Section	Interval VERT	Category CSG/CEMENT	Activit	ty NPT
00.00	01.00	2.00	,20		MIXED AND PUFOLLOWS: 186bbls OF W/ 40bbls GEL SP WATER SPACE 14.8ppg TAIL S DISPLACED CI 50 GOOD bbls	JMPED 13 3/8in SURF ATER AHEAD TO LOAI ACER, 30bbls WATER R, 156bbls OF 12.8pp LURRY AT 5bpm. DRI EMENT WITH 101bbls RETURNS, BUMPED	ACE CASING PRIMAR  D HOLE AND WASH D SPACER, 40bbis GEL g LEAD SLURRY AT 50 DPPED INTEGRITY TO OF WATER AT 5bpm.  PLUG AT 910.	EY CEMENT JOB AS OWN CASING, SPACER, 30bbls bpm, 101bbls OF DP PLUG AND			500,022		
					SoCl, 0.25lb/bb TAIL SLURRY:	: 156bbis (475sx, 1.85o of Cellofane Flake 101bbis (425sx, 1.34co of Cellofane Flake	, 9.50gal/sx FRESH Wa uft/sx) CLASS C PREM	ATER. MUM PLUS WITH 2%					
07:30	08:00	0.50	728	728	RDMO INTEGR	RITY 3. RIG RELEASE	D 03/16/16 AT 08:00.		SURF	VERT	CSG/CEMENT	RIG UP/RIG DOV	/N



## UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO.

Report End Date: 3/16/2016 Report Number: 2 Rig: INTEGRITY, 3 Projected Days (days): 0 Drilling Days: End MD (ftKB): 728 Depth Progress (ft): 667 Planned VS (ft): Current VS (ft): AFE Number: 1550336

	39595000					RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI R 2,559.00		County REAGAN		tate EXAS
Well S	ort Sur pud Date	)		otal Depth Dat	te	Rig Release Date	Target Fo					Proposed TD (ftKB)	
	at Repor					•	•				•		
	NG SUR		EMENI					Planned Operations					
PÙ BH		. F/ 21 F	T TO 728 F1	T, SWEEP HC	DLE, TOOH, RUI	N 13 3/8 SURFACE CAS		FINISH PUMPING S	URFACE CEMEN	NT, TEST (	CASING, RDMO		
Start M	ID (ftKB)				MD (ftKB)		Depth Progress (ft)	007	Drilling Time (h	ır)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	7/
Time	Loa		_	61		728		667	1	_	9.5	50	70
Start	End	Dur	Ctort Dont	n End Depth									
Time	Time	(hr)	(ftKB)	(ftKB)		Co	omments		Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	06:00	1.00	61	61	PU BHA 1.				SURF	VERT	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
06:00	15:00	9.00	61	715	SPUD WELL 03 ROTATE DRILL 100% ROTATE, FULL RETURN WATER FLOW	FROM 61ft - 715ft, 654 S.	ft AT 72.66fph		SURF	VERT	DRILL	DRILL W/ AIR	
15:00	22:00	7.00	715	715	RIG SHUT DOV	VN. TROUBLESHOOT	ING AND REPAIRING	ISSUE.	SURF	VERT	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
22:00	22:30	0.50	715	715	тін				SURF	VERT	DRILL	TRIPS	
22:30	23:00	0.50	715	728	ROTATE DRILL 100% ROTATE, FULL RETURN	FROM 715ft - 728ft, 13 S.	ft AT 26fph		SURF	VERT	DRILL	DRILL W/ AIR	
23:00	00:00	1.00	728	728	PUMP SWEEP	S			SURF	VERT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
00:00	02:00	2.00	728	728	тоон				SURF	VERT	DRILL	TRIPS	
02:00	02:30	0.50	728	728	LD BHA 1				SURF	VERT	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
02:30	04:30	2.00	728	3 728	BOTTOM AT 70 ANTELOPE BO JOINT. ANTELOPE SH ANTELOPE FLO	W SPRING CENTRALI	ZERS INSTALLED ON	N EVERY 4TH	SURF	VERT	DRILL	RUN CASING	
04:30	05:00	0.50	728	728		MENT HEAD. TESTED IMPED 13 3/8in SURFA			SURF	VERT	DRILL	RUN CEMENT	



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 3/24/2016 Report Number: 4

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: End MD (ftKB): 728 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft):

Current VS (ft): AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	39595000	00		- Ii	Surface L JNIVERS 10, SECT	egal Location	SURVEY, A-U21	12, BLOCK	Latitude 31.287	4000000		Orig KB El 2,559.00	RKB (ft) 21.00	County REAGAN			State TEXAS	
Repo	ort Sui	mmarv	,		10, 0201	0												
Well S	pud Date	)		otal De	epth Date	)	Rig Releas	se Date	Ta	arget Fo	rmation 410_SH				Propo	sed TD (ftKB)		40.705
Status	at Repor	5/2016 rt Time							W	/FMPD_	410_SH							18,725
			RS TO SQ	UAT R	IG FLOO	R					Diametric de la constitución de							
	tions Sun DRILL P		EPARE FO	R RIG	MOVE						Planned Operations RIG DOWN , MOVE		TY 10 RE 062	0 HD				
	ROM RIC		SE 11 6 HS ( WAI	LK)														
	MD (ftKB)			72		MD (ftKB)		728	Depth Progres	ss (ft)	(	Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg	g ROP (ft/hr)		
	Log																	
Start Time		Dur (hr)	Start Dept (ftKB)	th End	ftKB)				mments			Hole Sect	ion Interval	Catego	ory	Activity	,	NPT
18:00	05:00	11.00	72	28	728	CHANGE OU	JT GRABBER I	DIES ON TO	P DRIVE, RE	EMOVE RS HAN	DOUBLE BALL IG BLOCKS, CLOSE	MOB	МОВ	МОВ		RIG UP/RIG DOW	'N	
						DOORS ON	DRAG CHAIN, DOWN TM-12	, CLEAR FLO	oor, unhan	NG TON	GS, RETRACT CAT							



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 3/25/2016 Report Number: 5
Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: End MD (ftKB): 728 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): Current VS (ft): AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SURV 10, SECT 6	/EY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date Total 3/15/2016	Depth Date	Rig Release Date	Target For WFMPD_4	mation 110_SH				Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time RIGGING UP PITS			•				•		
Operations Summary	10 DE 0000 LID. EL 00D 001	LATED AT 40.00 DED	DICK DOWN AT	Planned Operations	DIC LID				
RIG DOWN , MOVE TO UNIVERSITY 1 12:30	IU RE 0620 HD, FLOOR SQI	JAIED AI 10:00 , DER	RICK DOWN AT	FINISH MOVING RIG	, RIG UP				
RIG DOWN 100 % MOVED 95 %									
SET IN 60 % RIGGED UP 15%									
MOVING WITH K E CONSTRUCTION , FORKLIFTS , 3 CRANES	12 HAUL TRUCKS , 2 TANE	DEMS , 2 GIN TRUCKS	, 2						
HRS FROM RIG RELEASE 35									
UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS ( WALK ) Start MD (ftKB)	End MD (ftKB)	In	epth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
	728	728	opan rogress (it)	(		()		7.19 1.01 (1.1.1.)	
Time Log	and Donth					_	ı		
Start End Dur Start Depth E Time Time (hr) (ftKB)	(ftKB)		nments		Hole Secti		Category		
05:00 05:00 24.00 728	10:00 , DERRICK	/E TO UNIVERSITY 10 DOWN AT 12:30 , HAL	JLED 50 LOADS, SI	ET PIT, ENGINES ,	MOB	MOB	MOB	RIG UP/RIG DOV	VN
	HOUSES , INSPI	DUSE , DIESEL TANKS ECTED 195 JOINTS DR	RILL PIPE, 1 SHOP	JOINT, 0 HARD					
	BAND,PULL WIR	ES FOR ENGINES AND	D PITS , RIG UP PITS	S					
	L								



Surface Legal Location

API

# AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary

#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Longitude

Latitude

Report End Date: 3/26/2016

Report Number: 6 Rig: UNIT, 407

Orig KB EI... RKB (ft) County

Projected Days (days): 18

Drilling Days:
End MD (ftKB): 728
Depth Progress (ft): 0
Planned VS (ft):
Current VS (ft):
AFE Number: 1550336

State

42383395950000		10, SECT		RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	31.2874000000	-101.4714300000	2,559.00	21.00	REAGAN		TEXAS	
Report Summary												
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	То	otal Depth Date	Э	Rig Release Date	Target Fo					Proposed TD (ftKB)		18,725
Status at Report Time	00.55::=			1	, b_	-==				1		, . 25
PULL TROLLEY OFF TO Operations Summary FINISH MOVE TO UNIV SET MUD HOUSE. RIG RIG FLOOR AT 23:30. RIG DOWN 100% MOVED 100% SET IN 98% RIGGED UP 75% RIGGING UP WITH K E DRILL PIPE INSPECTIO	/ERSITY 10 GGING UP S	OLIDS CONTE	rol Equipmen	T.RAISE DERRICK AT 19	P DERRICK	Planned Operations CONTINUE TO RIG	UP, NIPPLE UP	P AND TEST	, P/U 12 1/4	INTERMEDIATE BHA		
HRS FROM RIG RELEA UNIVERSITY 10 RE 060			AD (HIAD)	In.	and Dansen (ft)		Indian Ten (	L - )		IA DOD (#//s-s)		
Start MD (ftKB)		728 End II	MD (ftKB)	728	epth Progress (ft)	C	Drilling Time (I	nr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)		
Time Log												
Start End Dur Time Time (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)		Con	nments		Hole Section	n Interval	Catego	ry Activit	y	NPT
05:00 05:00 24.00	728		BUILD DERRICI SOLIDS CONTR AT 19:15 ,AFTE OUTSIDE PIN V SET WALKING AIR , HYD LINE POWER UP DR PIN SHOOTERS	VE, 100% MOVED, 90%  K, SET MUD HOUSE, SE  FOL EQUIPMENT. CHAN  R RAISING DERRICK W  YOULDNT GO IN , PREP,  FEET , BOP WINCHES,  S TO DRILLER CABIN AI  SILLERS CABIN , SET FF  S TO FREE UP AND LUE  TEST MUD PUMPS.	ET WATER TANKS, I GE HYDRILL RUBB HEN PINNED INSID ARE AND RAISE SU PULL AND HOOK I ND ODS HOUSE, I RONT STAIRS, UNIT	RIGGING UP SER, DERRICK UP SE PINS WENT IN, SIBS UP AT 23:30, SIP ELECTRICAL, DRAWWORKS, T MECH PULLED	МОВ	МОВ	МОВ	RIG UP/RIG DOV	ĪN	



## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 3/27/2016

Report Number: 7 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18

Drilling Days: End MD (ftKB): 728 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	95950000	)			Legal Location SITY LANDS SUF F6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI R 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
	rt Sun	nmary				la: a .	1-							
		2016	Tot	al Depth Date	9	Rig Release Date	Target Fo WFMPD_	rmation 410_SH				Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,	,725
	at Report LING TU		KLES											
RIGGIN		E CONS				00 HOURS, 3-26-2016. E UP AND TEST BOPE		Planned Operations P/U 12 1/4 INTERMI		RILL 12 1/4	INTERMEDIA	TE SECTION		
MOVED SET IN RIGGE		)%												
			N : AFTER F	REFACING 43	5 GOOD JOINTS	S , 1 SHOP JOINT								
	ROM RIG													
UNIVER Start M		RE 0606	6 HS ( WALK		MD (ftKB)	Ic	Depth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time (h	nr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)		
				728		728			0	,		3 4 (4 )		
Time Start	End	Dur	Start Depth	End Depth										
Time 05:00	Time 16:00	(hr)	(ftKB) 728	(ftKB)	BIG LID HOOK	Co UP HYDRAULIC LINES	mments	HOOK LIB MIID	Hole Section	Interval MOB	Categor	y Activity RIG UP/RIG DOW		PT
					TRANSFER LIN	ES, CHANGE SWIVEL F	PACKING.							
16:00	20:30	4.50	728	/28		LL CAP . INSTALLED SF ISTALLED ROTATING H			МОВ	МОВ	МОВ	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD		
20:30	01:30	5.00	728	728	TESTED SURFA BOTTOM AND I	ID TESTED CHOKE 250 ACE LINES , IBOP , MAI BLIND RAMS 250 LOW HIGH. TESTED BACK <sup>7</sup>	NUAL VALVE , DART 5,000 HIGH FOR 5 M	, TIW, TOP, MINUTE'S, HYDRIL	MOB	МОВ	МОВ	TEST B.O.P		
01:30	05:00	3.50	728	728	INSTALL DRIP F BHA, INSTALL T BHA #2. INSTAL	PAN, HOOK UP FILL UP FURNBUCKLES AND C LL WEAR BUSHING, L/E IR COVERS, PERFORI	LINE, CLEAN RIG F ENTER STACK. LAY WEAR BUSHING P	FLOOR TO PICK UP OUT DIRECTIONAL PULLER, AND	МОВ	мов	МОВ	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD		



API

## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 3/28/2016

Report Number: 8 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 1
End MD (ftKB): 2,002

Depth Progress (ft): 1,274 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 39 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000		Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SUF 10, SECT 6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000		Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Report Summary										
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total D	epth Date	Rig Release Date	Target For WFMPD_4				F	Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time DRILLING AT 2002 ft				·						
Operations Summary INSTALL MOUSEHOLE, CLEAN F SET UP TN-120, MAKE UP BHA EQUIPMENT FROM 663 ft TO 72 FROM 728 ft TO 2002 ft (1274 FT LAST SURVEY AT 1839 ft, INC 1 MUD WT 9.3 , VIS 51  DRILL PIPE INSPECTION; 574 G JOINT HRS FROM RIG RELEASE TO SF BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (W)	#2, TIH 28 ft. SF F) AT 10 0.1 , AZ GOOD J PUD 94 AT 16:3	. INSTALL ROTATING HE UD WELL 3/27/2016 AT 1 6.2fph 21 205.2 , TVD 1836.41 , V OINTS AFTER REFACING 5 0	AD, DRILL CEMENT AI 6:30 HOURS, ROTATE 'S 39.22 , 14.1 ABOVE , 3 , 200 BOXES , 44 PIN	IE AND PUMPS, ND FLOAT AND SLIDE 5.0 RIGHT IS , 1 SHOP	Planned Operations DRILL 12 1/4 INTER	MEDIATE SEC				
Start MD (ftKB)	-	End MD (ftKB)	2,002	Depth Progress (ft)	1,27	Drilling Time	(hr)	12.00	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	106.2
		20	2,002		1,27	4		12.00	7	106.2

Time	LUG									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	08:00	3.00	728		INSTALL MOUSEHOLE, CLEAN RIG FLOOR,INSTALL TRIP NIPPLE, LINE UP FLOW LINE AND PUMPS, SET TN-120.	MOB	MOB	MOB	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD	
08:00	10:30	2.50	728	728	MAKE UP BHA #2, P/U MOTOR, STB, MONEL #1, M/U BIT, TEST MOTOR, P/U MONEL #2.	MOB	МОВ	МОВ	P/U & L/D BHA	
10:30	11:30	1.00	728	728	P/U GAP SUB, INSTALL EM TOOL, PROGRAM EM TOOL.	MOB	МОВ	МОВ	P/U & L/D BHA	
11:30	13:00	1.50	728	728	P/U 2 MONELS, SHOCK SUB, X-OVER AND 1 6 1/2 DC.	MOB	МОВ	МОВ	P/U & L/D BHA	
13:00	14:00	1.00	728	728	TIH, TAGGED CEMENT @ 663 ft.	MOB	MOB	MOB	TRIPS	
14:00	16:30	2.50	728	728	INSTALL ROTATING HEAD, DRILL CEMENT AND FLOAT EQUIPMENT FROM 663 ft TO 728 ft.	MOB	MOB	MOB	REAMING	
16:30	19:00	2.50	728	961	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 728 ft TO 961 ft = 233 ft AT 93.2 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 233 ft IN 2.50 HOURS, 93.2 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0%  FULL RETURNS  *SPUD WELL ON 3/27/2016 AT 16:30 HRS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
19:00	19:30	0.50	961	961	CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD	INT	DIR	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
19:30	05:00	9.50	961	2,002	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 961 ft TO 2002 ft = 1041 ft AT 109.5 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 943 ft IN 6.75 HOURS, 139.7 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 98 ft IN 2.75 HOURS, 35.6 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 90% SLIDE, 10% FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 3/29/2016

Report Number: 9 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 2 End MD (ftKB): 3,470 Depth Progress (ft): 1,468 Planned VS (ft): 9,930

Current VS (ft): 280 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0			Legal Location SITY LANDS SUF Γ6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00	RKB (ft) 21.00	County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
_		nmary												
Well Sp	oud Date 3/15	/2016	Tota	l Depth Date	Э	Rig Release Date	Target Fo					Proposed TD (ftKB)		18,725
	at Report											•		
	NG AT 34							Planned Operations						
WELL F	LOWING	G, GAIN	10 BBLS, W	ELL FLOWI		fph , CIRC RAISE MUD WT FLOW , WELL STATIC	TO 9.6 ,	DRILL 12 1/4 INTER	MEDIATE SEC	TION TO +/-	7150 ft.			
LAST S	URVEY	AT 3346	ft , INC 9.9, A	XI 204.1 , T	VD 3318.25, VS	-280.14, 26.8 ABOVE ,	1.7 RIGHT							
MUD W	T 9.6 , V	/IS 54												
UNIVER	RSITY 10		/27/2016 AT 1 6 HS ( WALK	)	MD ((((D))		David David		In an array	(1-)		IA . DOD ((1))		
Start M	D (IIKB)			2,002	MD (ftKB)	3,470	Depth Progress (ft)	1,46	Drilling Time	(nr)	2	Avg ROP (ft/hr)		72.5
Time														
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)		Co	mments		Hole Sect	ion Interval	Catego	ory Activit	y	NPT
05:00	17:30	12.50	2,002	2,943	ft = 941 ft AT 75 ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 4 ROTATE, 95% S FULL RETURNS	899 ft IN 11.25 HOURS 2 ft IN 1.25 HOURS, 33 SLIDE, 5%	, 79.9 fph AVERAGE	ROP.	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD		
17:30 18:00	18:00 22:45	0.50 4.75	2,943 2,943		ft = 317 ft AT 66 ROTATE DRILL:	302 ft IN 4.25 HOURS, 5 ft IN .50 HOURS, 30. SLIDE, 5%	71.0 fph AVERAGE I	ROP.	INT INT	DIR DIR	DRILL DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG DRILL W/ MUD		
22:45	02:00	3.25	3,260	3,260		G , GAIN 10 BBLS , WE G , CIRCULATE SURFA , WELL STATIC			INT	DIR	DRILL	COND MUD & CIF	RC	
02:00	05:00	3.00	3,260	3,470	ft = 210 ft AT 70 ROTATE DRILL:	210 ft IN 3.00 HOURS, 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph / SLIDE, 0%	70.0 fph AVERAGE I		INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD		



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 3/30/2016 Report Number: 10 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 3
End MD (ftKB): 5,645 Depth Progress (ft): 2,175

Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 602 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0				RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI R 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
	ort Sun			al Depth Date		Rig Release Date	Target Fo	rmation				Proposed TD (ftKB)		
		/2016	100	ai Deptii Date		INIG Release Date	WFMPD_4					Floposed 1D (tikb)	18	3,725
DRILLI	NG AT 56	645						Planned Operations						
			OM 3470 ft T	O 5645 ft ( 2°	175 FT ) AT 92.6	fph		DRILL 12 1/4 INTER	MEDIATE SECTI	ON TO +/-	7150 ft.			
LAST S	SURVEY	AT 5511 f	ft , INC 5.5,	AZI 207 , TVE	0 5451.33, VS -6	01.97, 18.5 ABOVE , 0.4	4 RIGHT							
MUD W	/T 9.6 , V	'IS 50 , LO	CM 8 #											
UNIVE	RSITY 10		/27/2016 AT 6 HS ( WALK	)										
Start M	D (ftKB)			3,470 End N	MD (ftKB)	5,645	Depth Progress (ft)	2,17	Drilling Time (h	ır)	2	Avg ROP (ft/hr)		92.6
Time Start	Log	Dur	Start Depth	End Depth										
Time 05:00	Time 16:30	(hr)	(ftKB) 3,470	(ftKB)	ROTATE/SLIDE	DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTER	mments	OM 3470 ft TO 4732	Hole Section	Interval DIR	DRILL Catego	ory Activit	y N	IPT
			-, ·· ·	,,	ft = 1262ft AT 10 ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 7 ROTATE, 93% S	9.7 fph. 1185 ft IN 9.0 HOURS, 77 ft IN 2.50 HOURS, 30 SLIDE, 7%	131.6 fph AVERAGE	ROP.						
16:30	17:00	0.50	4,732	4,732	FULL RETURNS SERVICE RIG	5			INT	DIR	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG		
17:00	05:00	12.00	4,732	5,645	ft = 913 ft AT 76				INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD		
					ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 1 ROTATE, 88% S FULL RETURNS	811 ft IN 8.25 HOURS, 02 ft IN 3.75 HOURS, 2 SLIDE, 12%	98.3 fph AVERAGE F 7.2 fph AVERAGE RC	ROP. DP.						
					T OLL RETORNS	-								



Surface Legal Location

API

# AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary

#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Longitude

Latitude

Report End Date: 3/31/2016 Report Number: 11

Rig: UNIT, 407

Orig KB EI... RKB (ft) County

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 4 End MD (ftKB): 6,286 Depth Progress (ft): 641 Planned VS (ft): 9,930

Current VS (ft): 617 AFE Number: 1550336

State

42383395950000	10, SECT 6	S SURVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	31.2874000000	-101.4714300000	2,559.00	21.00	REAGAN		TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total Depth Date	Rig Release Date	Target For WFMPD_4				P	Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time LAYING DOWN BHA # 2		·					•		
Operations Summary ROTATE AND SLIDE 12 1/4 in. INT CIRCULATE BOTTOM'S UP, CHE LAYING DOWN 12 1/4 BHA #2 SURVEY AT 6,173 ft, INC 0.2°, A2 MUD WT 9.65, VIS 44, LCM 10# BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 / UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WAL	CK FLOW ( NO FLOW ) , ZI 340.3°, TVD 6,111.74 ft., AT 16:30 _K)	PUMP SLUG , TRIP OUT OF	11 ft.) AT 37.2 fph , F HOLE TO 204 ft ,	Planned Operations FINISH C/O BHA , TI	RIP IN HOLE	, DRILL 12 1/4	INTERMEDIATE	E SECTION TO +/- 7150	ft.
Start MD (ftKB)	End MD (ftKB) 5,645	6,286	Depth Progress (ft)	641	Drilling Time	(hr)	17.25	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	37.2
Time Log									

Time	LUG									
Start	End	Dur	Start Depth							
Time	Time	(hr)	(ftKB)	(ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	16:30	11.50	5,645	·	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 5,645 ft TO 6,148 ft = 503 ft AT 44.7 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 451 ft IN 7.50 HOURS, 60.1 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 52 ft IN 4.00 HOURS, 13.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 97% SLIDE, 03%  FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
					NOTE: TRANSFER LIGHT MUD FROM MUD FRAC TANKS, TOOK ON 90 bbls. OF WATER DUE TO MUD WEIGHT FALLING FROM 9.6 ppg. TO 9.45 ppg. ADJUSTED AND GOT MUD WEIGHT TO 9.65 ppg AND WELLBORE STABILIZED.					
16:30	17:00	0.50	6,148		RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE	INT	DIR	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
17:00	22:30	5.50	6,148	·	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 6,148 ft TO 6,286 ft = 138 ft AT 25.0 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 138 ft IN 5.50 HOURS, 25.0 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0% FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
22:30	00:00	1.50	6,286	6,286	CIRCULATE BOTTOM'S UP , BUILD SLUG , CHECK FLOW , ( WELL STATIC	INT	DIR	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
00:00	04:30	4.50	6,286	6,286	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 204 ft	INT	DIR	DRILL	TRIPS	
04:30	05:00	0.50	6,286	6,286	LAYING DOWN 12 1/4 BHA # 2	INT	DIR	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/1/2016 Report Number: 12

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 5
End MD (ftKB): 6,570 Depth Progress (ft): 284 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 617 AFE Number: 1550336

11			1		2,559.00		REAGAN		TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date Total De 3/15/2016	pth Date	Rig Release Date	Target For WFMPD_4				Pi	roposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time DRILLING AT 6,570							•		
Operations Summary L/D 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE BHA #2, P/ AND REAM FROM 2,960 ft. TO 6,286 ft. F 6,286 ft TO 6,570 ft (284 ft.) AT 40.6 fph SURVEY AT 6,452 ft , INC 0,1°, AZI 183.4° MUD WT 9.65, VIS 44, LCM 10# BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 AT 16:30 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WALK)	ROTATE AND SLIDE 12 <sup>-</sup> , TVD 6,391.74 ft., VS -6	1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE :	960 ft., WASH SECTION FROM 0.1 LEFT	Planned Operations DRILL 12 1/4 INTERI			150 ft		
Start MD (ftKB) 6,28	End MD (ftKB)	6,570	Depth Progress (ft)	284	Drilling Time	(hr)	7.50	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	37.9

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	07:30	2.50	6,286		MAKE UP SMITH SDSI616MEPX BIT (SIERAL JM0248), P/U SHOCK SUB, DRILL COLARS	INT	DIR	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
07:30	08:00	0.50	6,286		TIH WITH 5 STANDS TO 678 ft. BRAKE OFF SINGLE AND STAB ROTATING HEAD	INT	DIR	DRILL	TRIPS	
08:00	08:30	0.50	6,286	6,286	PULL TRIP NIPPLE AND INSTALL ROTATING HEAD	INT	DIR	DRILL	BOP/OTHER	
08:30	09:00	0.50	6,286		RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE. C/O VALVE ON ROTATING HEAD.	INT	DIR	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	
09:00	11:00	2.00	6,286		TIH WITH BHA #3 FROM 678 ft. TO 2,960 ft., WELLBORE GIVING CALCULATED DISPLACEMENT. (WASHED 1 STAND DOWN AT 1,547 ft. TO 1,629 ft.)	INT	DIR	DRILL	TRIPS	
11:00	21:30	10.50	6,286	6,286	WASH AND REAM FROM 2,960 ft TO 6,286 ft	INT	DIR	DRILL	REAMING	
21:30	23:30	2.00	6,286	·	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 6,286 ft TO 6,300 ft = 14 ft AT 9.3 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 14 ft IN 1.50 HOURS, 9.3 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0%  FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	Yes
23:30	05:00	5.50	6,300	.,	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 6,300 ft TO 6,570 ft = 270 ft AT 49.0 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 270 ft IN 5.50 HOURS, 49.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0%  FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	



6,570

## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/2/2016 Report Number: 13

Rig: UNIT, 407

9.50

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 6
End MD (ftKB): 6,745 Depth Progress (ft): 175 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 617 AFE Number: 1550336

18.4

42383395950000	UNIVERSITY LANDS SI 10, SECT 6	JRVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	31.2874000000		2,559.00		REAGAN		TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total Depth Date	Rig Release Date	Target Fo WFMPD_					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time WASHING AND REAMING AT 5,8	300 ft								
Operations Summary ROTATE/SLIDE 12 1/4 in. INTERI CIRCULATE FOR TRIP DUE TO 5,685 ft , WASH AND REAM F/ 5, SURVEY AT 6,642 ft , INC 0.1°, A MUD WT 9.65, VIS 46, LCM 08# BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WA	PENETRATION RATE, T.O.H. T 685 ft TO 5,800 ft IZI 127.2°, TVD 6,581.74 ft., VS AT 16:30	/ 204 , C/O BIT AND MÓT	T 18.4 fph, OR , T.I.H. T/	Planned Operations FINISH WASHING A	ND REAMING	, -,	RILL 12 1/4 IN	ITERMEDIATE SECTION TO	+/- 7150 ft
Start MD (ftKB)	End MD (ftKB)	D	epth Progress (ft)	·	Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	

175

6,745

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	14:30	9.50	6,570	.,	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 6,570 ft TO 6,745 ft = 175 ft AT 18.4 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 175 ft IN 9.50 HOURS, 18.4 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0%  FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
14:30	15:30	1.00	6,745	6,745	CIRCULATE FOR TRIP DUE TO PENETRATION RATE. BUILD SLUG, FILL TRIP TANK, AND PREPARE FOR TRIP. FLOW CHECK (WELL STATIC), PUMP SLUG	INT	DIR	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
15:30	20:30	5.00	6,745	6,745	POOH OF BIT AND BHA C/O. CONTINUOUS FILL ON BACKSIDE WITH TRIP TANK. WELLBORE TAKING CALCULATED FILL. TO 204'	INT	DIR	DRILL	TRIPS	
20:30	01:00	4.50	6,745	.,	LAY DOWN SHOCK SUB,RACK COLLARS IN DERRICK, DRAIN MOTOR, BREAK BIT, P/U AND M/U SECURITY 12 1/4 MM65D (SERIAL 12757365) AND 8" 7/8,4.0 STG MOTOR,1.75 FIXED W/ SLICK SLEEVE (SERIAL C2-203033), BREAK GAP SUB CHANGE 2 BATTERIES PROGRAM EM TOOL, T.I.H. W/ COLLARS, P/U SHOCK SUB	INT	DIR	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
01:00	04:30	3.50	6,745	6,745	TRIP IN HOLE (SLM ) TO 5,685 ft	INT	DIR	DRILL	TRIPS	
04:30	05:00	0.50	6.745	6,745	WASH AND REAM FROM 5.685 ft TO 5.800 ft	INT	DIR	DRILL	REAMING	



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/3/2016 Report Number: 14 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 7 End MD (ftKB): 7,216

Depth Progress (ft): 471 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 626 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	U	urface Legal Location NIVERSITY LANDS SUF ), SECT 6	JRVEY, A-U212, BLOCK		374000000		Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Report Summary											
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total Dep	oth Date	Rig Release Date		Target For WFMPD_4				F	Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time MAKE UP SHOE TRACK									•		
Operations Summary WASH AND REAM F/ 5,800 ft TC 6,745 ft TO 7,216 ft (471 ft. AT 72 WEAR BUSHING, PJSM R/U EXI SURVEY AT 7,138 ft , INC 1.9°, A MUD WT 9.60, VIS 47, LCM 08# BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WA	.5 fph) , C PRESS C ZI 157.1° AT 16:30	CIRC 3 BTTM'S UP , CH ASING TO RUN 9 5/8, I , TVD 7,077.62 ft., VS -6	ECK FLOW , T.O.H. L/ WU SHOE TRACK TE: 325.68 ft., 7.3 BELOW	D BHA # 4 ,F ST FLOAT , 3.8 RIGHT	OM PULL	Planned Operations RUN 9 5/8 CASING	, CEMENT , PA		B , P/U CURVE B		
Start MD (ftKB)	0.74	End MD (ftKB)		Depth Progr	ress (ft)	47.	Drilling Time	(hr)	0.54	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	70.5
	6,74		7,216			47	1		6.50	)	72.5

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	(ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	10:00	5.00	6,745	6,745	WASH AND REAM FROM 5,800 ft. TO 6,745 ft., NO ISSUES	INT	DIR	DRILL	REAMING	
10:00	15:45	5.75	6,745		ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 6,745 ft TO 7,176 ft = 431 ft AT 75.0 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 416 ft IN 5.00 HOURS, 83.2 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 415 ft IN 0.75 HOURS, 20.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 96% SLIDE, 4%  FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
15:45	16:15	0.50	7,176	7,176	RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.	INT	DIR	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
16:15	17:00	0.75	7,176		ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 12 1/4 in. INTERMEDIATE HOLE FROM 7,176 ft TO 7,216 ft = 40 ft AT 53.3 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 40 ft IN 0.75 HOURS, 53.3 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 00 ft IN 0.0 HOURS, 0.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0%  FULL RETURNS	INT	DIR	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
17:00	20:00	3.00	7,216	,	CIRCULATE FOR 9 5/8 in. INTERMEDIATE CASING RUN DUE TO INTERMEDIATE SECITON TD. CIRCULATING AT 746 gpm AND 50 rpm ON ROTARY. CIRCULATE 3 BOTTOM'S UP, FLOW CHECK (WELL STATIC), PUMP SLUG	INT	DIR	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
20:00	00:00	4.00	7,216	7,216	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 198 ft	INT	DIR	DRILL	TRIPS	
00:00	02:00	2.00	7,216		L/D; X-O,6/1/2 DC,X-O , SHOCK SUB , 2-MONEL'S,EMSUB,2-MONEL'S ,8" MOTOR 1.75 SERIAL C2-203033 , SECURITY 12 1/4 MM65D BIT SERIAL 12757365	INT	DIR	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
02:00	03:00	1.00	7,216	7,216	PULL WEAR BUSHING , CLEAR RIG FLOOR , PULL ELEVATOR'S	INT	DIR	DRILL	BOP/OTHER	
03:00	04:30	1.50	7,216		HELD PJSM WITH EXPRESS CASING CREW, RIG CREW, TP AND CO-MAN. RIG UP 9 5/8 in. CASING RUNNING TOOLS	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING	
04:30	05:00	0.50	7,216	7,216	M/U SHOE TRACK, TEST FLOATS,	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING	



7,216 TRIP IN HOLE TO 2,000 ft

## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/4/2016 Report Number: 15

Rig: UNIT, 407 Projected Days (days): 18

Drilling Days: 8 End MD (ftKB): 7,216 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 626 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0			Legal Location SITY LANDS SURVEY T 6	/, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI RI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Repo	ort Sun	nmarv											
	oud Date			otal Depth Dat	e Rig	Release Date	Target Fo WFMPD_4					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
	at Report		0 000 (		•						•		
	NG IN HO		2,000 π					Planned Operations					
ft., P/U CASING INSTAL SURVE MUD W BIG RIG	AND LA G ,TEST L WEAR Y AT 7,1 /T 9.60, \ G SPUD	ND THE 9 5/8 CA BUSHIN 38 ft , IN VIS 50, L DATE ; 3	LANDING NASING TO 1: NG,P/U CUR NC 1.9°, AZI .CM 08# 8/27/2016 AT	MANDREL, CI 500 , FLUSH RVE BHA # 5 , 157.1°, TVD 7	FLOAT, RUN 9 5/8 ir RCULATE FOR CEM STACK, INSTALL PA T.I.H. TO 2,000 ft 7,077.62 ft., VS -625.6	ENT JOB , CEMEN CK OFF , TEST TO	T 9 5/8 0 3,000 PSI,	FINISH TRIPPING IN	N HOLE , DRLG (	OUT , DRL	G VERTICAL S	ECTION , BUILD CURVE	
		RE 060	6 HS (WALK	,	15 (CLCS)	1-			Is	,		L. 505 ((1)	
Start M	D (ftKB)			7,216	MD (ftKB)	7,216	Depth Progress (ft)	(	Drilling Time (h	r)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
Time	Log												
Start	End	Dur		h End Depth		0.			11-1- 0	1.1	0.1	A of the	NIDT
05:00	13:30	(hr) 8.50	(ftKB) 7,216	(ftKB) 7,216	FINISH M/U SHOE		mments LOATS. RAN 9 5/8 IN	NTERMEDIATE	Hole Section	Interval	CSG/CEMENT		y NPT
00.00	10.00	0.00	7,210	7,210	CASING, TOTAL JO JOINT. 71 jts. OF HO	INTS RUN 162 + H. CL-80 TO 3,954.8 ft. OAT COLLAR AT 7,	ANGER, PUP JOINT , 91 jts. OF J-55 TO 109.8 ft. P/U TAG JOI	AND LANDING SURFACE, SHOE		DiiX	OGO/GENIEN	it of ordine	
13:30	14:00	0.50	7,216	7,216	PICK UP PUP JOIN OUT 9 5/8 in. CASIN		REL, AND LANDING REL 290K - 42K BLO		INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	Γ RUN CASING	
14:00	16:30	2.50	7,216	7,216		CIRCULATED CAP ROKES) FULL RET	PACITY AND HALF C	F CASING	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	COND MUD & CIR	.c
16:30	20:00	3.50	7,216	7,216	PRESSURE TEST L 50 bbls 10.2 ppg 40 LEAD = 1,095 SACKS ( WITNESSED MANU 12.5 ppg OBM. PUN 3 bpm FOR THE LA BUMPING PLUG W BLED OFF PRESSI OF LEAD AT SURF;	IMP 2 bbls. OF FRE INES TO 2,000 pc. O lbs/bbl. LCM/WE IS (613 bbls) 50/50 S9 bbls) C+ CEMED AL DROPPING OF AP 479 bbls AT PUM ST 60 bbls. BUMPE AS 340 psi, PRESS IRE, BLED 2 bbls E ACE, ESTIMATED T	SH WATER TO FLU: PUMPED CEMENT IGHTED C-63 + DUR (POZ/C), 11.5 ppg, 2 IT, 13.2 ppg, 1.61 yd, PLUG, DISPLACED IP RATE AVG 6 bpm, ED PLUG, PRESSUR URE INCREASE TO	SH LINES AND JOB AS FOLLOWS; A FIBER SPACER; .63 yd, 14.82 gps; 7.98 gps. WITH 539 bbls OF SLOWED RATE TO E BEFORE 910 psi (570 OVER), D, ESTIMATED TOP : ft., FULL	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	FUN CEMENT	
20:00	20:30	0.50	7,216	7,216	PRESSURE TEST S CASING PRESSURI CEMENTING PRES	E TEST OF 1,500 p	si. FOR 30 mins. CH/		INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING	
20:30	21:00	0.50	7,216	7,216	RIGGED DOWN CE	MENTERS AND PL	JMPED THROUGH B	OP WITH WATER.	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CEMENT	
21:00	22:00	1.00	7,216	7,216	BACKED OUT LAND		AID DOWN. REMOVI		INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	Γ RUN CASING	
22:00	00:00	2.00	7,216	7,216	PU JOINT OF HWD TESTED PACK OFF AND LAID DOWN JO	TO 3000 psi (GOO	D TEST). BACKED (		INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	BOP/OTHER	
00:00	01:00	1.00	7,216	7,216	INSTALL WEAR BU	SHING , CLEAR RIG	G FLOOR ( CLEAN P	PITS )	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	BOP/OTHER	
01:00	03:30	2.50	7,216	7,216	BIT SERIAL SO9708	3, X-O SUB, NM F	SERIAL C2-171182 , LEX PONY DC ,NM M FLEX DC , SHOCK	I FLEX DC , NM D-	INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	F/U & L/D BHA	
03:30	05:00	1.50	7,216	7,216	TRIP IN HOLE TO 2	,000 ft			INT	DIR	CSG/CEMENT	TRIPS	



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/5/2016 Report Number: 16 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 9
End MD (ftKB): 7,900 Depth Progress (ft): 684 Planned VS (ft): 9,930

Current VS (ft): 626 AFE Number: 1550336

ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION CURVE FROM 7,745 ft TO 7,900 ft (155 ft AT 31.0 fph ) SURVEY AT 7,798 ft , INC 8.1°, AZI 355.6°, TVD 7,737.30 ft., VS -626.07 ft., 7.7 BELOW, 2.2 RIGHT MUD WT 11.8, VIS 63 BIG RIG SPUD DATE : 3/27/2016 AT 16.30 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WALK)  Start MD (ftKB)  7,216	State TEXAS
Statu   End   Dur   Time   Log   End   MD (fit/SB)   Type   End   MD (fit/SB)   Type   Time   Log   Comments   Type   Time   Log   Comments   Type   Time   Log   Type	
Status at Report Time   BUILDING CURVE AT 7,900 ft   Operations   Summary TILL H. TO 7,108 ft., DRILL 9 5/8 in. CASING SHOE TRACK AND OPEN HOLE CEMENT FROM 7,108 ft. TO 7,726 it., DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION VERTICAL FROM 7,216 ft. TO 7,746 it. (526 ft. AT 36.5 fph.)	
Dillibric CURVE AT 7,906 ft   Dillibric Curve	18,725
TI.H. TO 7,108 ft., DRILL 9 5/8 in. CASING SHOE TRACK AND OPEN HOLE CEMENT FROM 7,108 ft. TO 7,216 ft., DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION VERTICAL FROM 7,216 ft. TO 7,745 ft. (529 ft. AT 36.5 ft) at 7.216 ft. DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION VERTICAL FROM 7,216 ft. TO 7,745 ft. (529 ft. AT 36.5 ft) at 7.216 ft. DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION CURVE FROM 7,745 ft. TO 7,900 ft (155 ft. AT 31.0 fph.)  SURVEY AT 7,798 ft. INC 8.1*, A21 355.6*, TVD 7,737.30 ft., VS -626.07 ft., 7.7 BELOW, 2.2 RIGHT MUD WT 11.8, VIS 63  BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 AT 16:30  UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 ft. WALK)  TIME LOT 10 RE 0606 ft. WALK)  TIME STATE AND A STANDAR STAN	
7,216 ft., DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION VERTICAL FROM 7,216 ft. TO 7,745 ft. (529 ft. AT 36.5 fph).  ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION CURVE FROM 7,745 ft. 105 9t. AT 10.5 ph.  SURVEY AT 7,798 ft., INC 8.1°, AZI 355.6°, TVD 7,737.30 ft., VS -626.07 ft., 7.7 BELOW, 2.2 RIGHT  MUD WT 11.8, VIS 63  BIG RIG SPUD DATE : 3/27/2016 AT 16:30  UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WALK)  Start MD (ftKB)  7,216  Fine Log  Start Depth (ftKB)  Time Log  Start Depth (ftKB)  T,216  Fine MD	
BIG RIG SPUD DATE : 3/27/2016 AT 16:30   UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WALK)	
Start MD (ft/KB)	
Time   Log   Start   End   Dur   Start Depth   End Depth   (fit/8)   Comments   Hole Section   Interval   Category   Activity	
Start   Find   Time   Log	
Start   Find   Time	35.1
Time	
05:00   08:00   3.00   7,216   7,216   7,216   TIH WITH 8 3/4 in. VERTICAL/CURVE BHA #5 TO 7,108 ft., FILLING DRILL STRING EVERY 30 STANDS, WELLBORE GIVING CALCULATED DISPLACEMENT.   STRING EVERY 30 STANDS, WELLBORE GIVING CALCULATED DISPLACEMENT.   OBSTACEMENT.   OBSTACEMENT.   OBSTACEMENT.   OBSTACEMENT.   OBSTACE PROM 7,108 ft. TO 7,216 ft. 5K WOB, WASHING AT 350 gpm, AND REAMING AT 20 rpm.   OBSTACEMENT.   OBSTACEMEN	NPT
08:00         09:00         1.00         7,216         7,216         DRILL 9 5/8 in. INTERMEDIATE CASING SHOE TRACK FROM 7,108 ft. TO 7,204 ft., DRILL OPEN HOLE CEMENT TO 7,216 ft. 5K WOB, WASHING AT 350 gpm, AND REAMING AT 20 rpm.         INT         DIR         CSG/CEMENT         REAMING           09:00         15:30         6.50         7,216         7,412         ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. VERTICAL HOLE FROM 7,216 ft TO 7,412 ft = 196 ft AT 30.2 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 181 ft IN 5.75 HOURS, 31.5 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 15 ft IN 0.75 HOURS, 20.0 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 92% SLIDE, 08% FULL RETURNS         PROD         DIR         DRILL         DRILL         DRILL W/ MUD           15:30         16:00         0.50         7,412         7,412         RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.         PROD         DIR         DRILL         LUBRICATE RIG	INF I
09:00         15:30         6.50         7,216         7,412         ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. VERTICAL HOLE FROM 7,216 ft TO 7,412 ft = 196 ft AT 30.2 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 181 ft IN 5.75 HOURS, 31.5 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 15 ft IN 0.75 HOURS, 20.0 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 92% SLIDE, 08% FULL RETURNS         PROD         DIR         DRILL         DRILL W/ MUD           15:30         16:00         0.50         7,412         7,412         RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.         PROD         DIR         DRILL         LUBRICATE RIG	
SLIDE DRILL: 15 ft IN 0.75 HOURS, 20.0 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 92% SLIDE, 08% FULL RETURNS  15:30 16:00 0.50 7,412 7,412 RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.  DRILL LUBRICATE RIG	
EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.	
16:00 00:00 8.00 7,412 7,745 ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. VERTICAL HOLE FROM 7,412 ft TO 7745 ft = PROD DIR DRILL DRILL W/ MUD 333 ft AT 41.6 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 333 ft IN 8.00 HOURS, 41.6 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 0.0 ft IN 0.0 HOURS, 0.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.	
ROTATE, 100% SLIDE, 0% FULL RETURNS 00:00   05:00   5.00   7,745   7,800   ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION CURVE FROM 7,745 ft TO 7,900   PROD   CURVE   DRILL   DRILL W/ MUD	
ft = 155 ft AT 31.0 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 0.0 ft IN 0.0 HOURS, 0.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 155 ft IN 5.0 HOURS, 31.0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, 100%  FULL RETURNS	



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/6/2016 Report Number: 17 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 10 End MD (ftKB): 8,852 Depth Progress (ft): 952 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 59 AFE Number: 1550336

42383395950000	Įι	JNIVERSITY LANDS SUF 0, SECT 6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	31.28740000	-101.4714300000	2,559.00		REAGAN		TEXAS		
Report Summary												
Well Spud Date	Total De	pth Date	Rig Release Date		Formation			F	Proposed TD (ftKB)			
3/15/2016				WFMPI	D_410_SH					18,725		
Status at Report Time												
ROUBLESHOOT EM TOOL												
Operations Summary					Planned Operations							
ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. P	RODUC	TION CURVE FROM 7,90	00 ft TO 8,852 ft (948 ft	AT 41.2 fph).			OUT OF HOLE	FOR LATERAL	ASSEMBLY. TRIP IN H	OLE. SOFT LAND		
TROUBLESHOOT EM TOOL.					CURVE. DRILL LATE	ERAL.						
SURVEY AT 8,777 ft , INC 77.9°,	AZI 0.5°,	TVD 8,352.53 ft., VS 59.	.34 ft., DLS- 2.60°, DLN	I- 7.70°, 11.6ft								
AHEAD, 0.3 RIGHT												
MUD WT 11.9, VIS 59	AT 40 00											
BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WA		)										
	ALN)											
Start MD (ftKB)		End MD (ftKB)		Depth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	e (hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)			
	7 00	nni	8 852		95	21		23.0	ΛI	/1 /		

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	04:00	23.00	7,800	·	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION CURVE FROM 7,900 ft TO 8852ft = 948 ft AT 41.2 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 503ft IN 10.5 HOURS, 47.9 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 449 ft IN 12.5 HOURS, 35.9 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 53% SLIDE, 47% FULL RETURNS	PROD	CURVE	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
04:00	05:00	1.00	8,852	8,852	TROUBLESHOOT EM TOOL (LOST SIGNAL)	PROD	CURVE	DRILL	DIRECTIONAL WORK	Yes



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/7/2016 Report Number: 18

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 11 End MD (ftKB): 8,949 Depth Progress (ft): 97 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 136 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SU 10, SECT 6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000		Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total Depth Date	Rig Release Date	Target Fo WFMPD_					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time DRILLING CURVE AT 8949 ft		•	•						
Operations Summary TROUBLESHOOT EM TOOL, CIR ASSEMBLY), P/U BHA No. 6 (8 3/ LATERAL BHA, REAMED THROUG HEAD RUBBER. ROTATE SLIDE E SURVEY AT 8,855 ft, INC 83.4°, A 0 RIGHT/LEFT MUD WT 11.8+, VIS 61 BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 A UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WAL	4 in. LATERAL ASSEMBLY). TR GH CURVE FROM 7970; ft 75 SRILL FROM 8852 ft TO 8949 ft IZI 0.1°, TVD 8,365.02 ft., VS 1: AT 16:30 LK)	IPPED IN HOLE TO 797( 8852 ft. CHANGED OUT 66.27 ft., DLS- 6.62°, DLN	(8 3/4 in. CURVE 0 ft WITH ROTATING N- 7°, 5ft ABOVE,	Planned Operations DRILL LATERAL SE	CTION TO PR		DF 18725 ft.		
Start MD (ftKB)	End MD (ftKB) 8,852	8,949	epth Progress (ft)	9	Drilling Time	(hr)	2	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	38.8

			8,852	8,949	97			2.50		38.8	
Time	Log										
Start Time	End Time	(hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	(ftKB)	Comments		Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	06:30	1.50	8,852	8,852	CIRCULATE FOR POOH DUE TO DOWNHOLE EM TOOL FAILURE, PUMPING AT 510 gpm AND NO ROTATING. FLOW CHECK (WELL STATIC)	i	PROD	CURVE	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
06:30	08:00	1.50	8,852	8,852	POOH WITH WET STRING TO TOP OF THE CURVE AT 7,645 ft. CONTINUES FILL ON BACKSIDE WITH TRIP TANK, WELLBORE TAKING CALCULATED FILL. PUMP WEIGHTED SLUG		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	TRIPS	
08:00	12:30	4.50	8,852	8,852	POOH TO TOP OF THE BHA No. 5 AT 150 ft. CONTINUES FILL ON BACKSIDE WITH TRIP TANK, WELLBORE TAKING CALCULATED FILL.		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	TRIPS	
12:30	13:00	0.50	8,852	8,852	REMOVE HYDRAULIC SLIPS, PULL ROTATING HEAD, AND INSTALL FLOW NIPPLE		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	BOP/OTHER	
13:00	15:00	2.00	8,852	8,852	L/D BHA No. 5: RACK BACK DOUBLE MONEL AND SHOCK SUB WITH SINGLE DRILL PIPE, BREAK OUT GAP SUB AND INSPECT EM TOOL FOR DAMAGE, BREAK DOWN EM TOOL AND L/D GAP SUB, DRAIN MUD MOTOR, BREAK OUT BIT, L/D PONY MONEL AND MUD MOTOR. GRADED BIT No. 5: PDC LOGIC 8 3/4 in. PLD516 S5 1-1-WT-A-X-0-NO-DTF	E	PROD	CURVE	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
15:00	17:30	2.50	8,852	8,852	P/U BHA No. 6: P/U MONEL AND MUD MOTOR, TEST MUD MOTOR, M/U BIT No. 6, M/U AND UPLOAD EM TOOL, SCRIBE MUD MOTOR, M/U 2 MONELS OUT OF DERRICK, L/D 1 JOINT OF DRILL PIPE.		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
17:30	18:00	0.50	8,852	8,852	RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
18:00	19:00	1.00	8,852	8,852	TROUBLESHOOT TM-120		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
19:00	00:30	5.50	8,852	8,852	TIH WITH 8 3/4 in. LATERAL BHA #6 TO 7,970 ft., FILLING DRILL STRING EVERY 30 STANDS, WELLBORE GIVING CALCULATED DISPLACEMENT.		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	TRIPS	
00:30	02:00	1.50	8,852	8,852	WASH AND REAM THROUGH CURVE FROM 7,970 ft TO 8,852 ft.		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	REAMING	
02:00	02:30	0.50	8,852	8,852	CHANGED OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBER.		PROD	CURVE	DRILL	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD	Yes
02:30	05:00	2.50 8,852 8,949 ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION CURVE FROM 8,85: ft = 97 ft AT 38.8 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 15 ft IN 0.25 HOURS, 60 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 82 ft IN 2.25 HOURS, 36.4 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE, 16% SLIDE, 84% FULL RETURNS					PROD	CURVE	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/8/2016 Report Number: 19

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 12 End MD (ftKB): 10,836 Depth Progress (ft): 1,887 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 1,957 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0				RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI RF 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
	rt Sun		1										
Well Sp	oud Date	/2016	Tot	al Depth Date	e	Rig Release Date	Target For WFMPD 4					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status	at Report						W W D_1	110_011				ı	10,720
			10,836 ft.					Planned Operations					
ROTATI CONTR CONTR SURVE RIGHT MUD W BIG RIG	OLED A OLED A Y AT 10, T 11.8+, S SPUD	DRILL 8 T 150 FF T 100 FF 679 ft , I VIS 56 DATE ; 3	PH FROM 98 PH FROM 99	95 ft TO 9988 88 ft TO 10,8 21 3.4°, TVD 8 16:30	8,949 ft TO 9,895 3 ft ( 93 ft AT 93 36 ft ( 848 ft AT ,385.53 ft., VS 19	CTION TO PROP	OSED TD	OF 18,725 ft.					
Start M	D (ftKB)				MD (ftKB)		Pepth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time (h	r)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
Time	Log			8,949		10,836		1,887	1		23	.50	80.3
Start	End	Dur	Start Depth	End Depth									
Time 05:00	Time 16:00	(hr)	(ftKB) 8.949	(ftKB) 9.867	DOTATE (OLIDE	Co DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODU	mments	ON 0 0 40 (1 TO	Hole Section	Interval	Categor	ny Activity DRILL W/ MUD	/ NPT
03.00	10.00	11.00	0,545	9,007	9,895 ft = 946 ft ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 1 ROTATE, 85% S WELLBORE SE	AT 86.0 fph. 802 ft IN 7.0 HOURS, 1 44 ft IN 4.0 HOURS, 36	14.6 fph AVERAGE R .0 fph AVERAGE ROF	ROP. P. WITH 20 ppb LCM	PROD	LAI	DNIEL	DNILL W/ MOD	
16:00	17:00	1.00	9,867	9,988	9,895 ft TO 9,98 ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 1 ROTATE 84%, S CONTROL DRIL FINES, MIXING	CONTROL DRILL 8 3/4 18 ft = 93 ft AT 93.0 fph. 78 ft IN 0.50 HOURS, 1 5 ft IN 0.50 HOURS, 30 SLIDE 16% L AT 150 fph, PUMPING 6 sph OF CEDAR FIBE WALNUT MEDIUM IN SU	56.0 fph AVERAGE R .0 fph AVERAGE ROF G LCM SWEEPS WITI R, 6 sph OF COTTON	ROP. P. H 20 ppb LCM	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
17:00	17:30	0.50	9,988	9,988		GREASE AND CHECK I ERVICE TOPDRIVE.	FLUID LEVELS ON D	RILLING	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
17:30	05:00	11.50	9,988	10,836	9,988 ft TO 10,8 ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 9 ROTATE 89%, S CONTROL DRIL MIXING 10 sph	CONTROL DRILL 8 3/4 436 ft = 848 ft AT 73.7 fpi 758 ft IN 9 HOURS, 84. 90 ft IN 2.5 HOURS, 36 f SLIDE 11% L AT 100 fph, PUMPING OF CEDAR FIBER, 10 s IT MEDIUM IN SUCTION	h. 2 fph AVERAGE ROF ph AVERAGE ROP. 3 LCM SWEEPS WITI sph OF COTTONSEE	e. H 20 ppb LCM,	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
_													



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/9/2016 Report Number: 20 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18

Drilling Days: 13
End MD (ftKB): 12,359
Depth Progress (ft): 1,523
Planned VS (ft): 9,930
Current VS (ft): 3,461
AFE Number: 1550336

API 4238339595	50000					EVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	31.28740000	-101.4714300000	2,559.00		REAGAN		TEXAS	
Report S	Sum	mary												
Well Spud	Date 3/15/2	016	Tot	tal Depth Dat	е	Rig Release Date		Formation D_410_SH				Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725	
Status at Ro DRILLING L			12,359 ft.									•		
Planned Operations   Planned														
Start MD (ft	tKB)			2		64.8								
Time Log														
	ind ime	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)		Cor	mments		Hole Section	n Interval	Catego	ory Activ	vity NPT	
05:00 17:	:00	12.00	10,836	11,610	10,836 ft TO 11, ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 2 ROTATE 74%, S LOSSES SLOW CONTROL DRIL		oh. 84.7 fph AVERAGI 3.5 fph AVERAGE G LCM SWEEPS W	E ROP. ROP. VITH 25 ppb LCM	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD		
17:00 17:	:30	0.50	11,610	11,610		GREASE AND CHECK F ERVICE TOPDRIVE.	FLUID LEVELS ON	N DRILLING	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	;	
17:30 05:	:00	11.50	11,610	12,359	11,610 ft TO 12, ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 1 ROTATE 77%, S (FULL RETURN CONTROL DRIL		oh. 91.8 fph AVERAGI 3.3 fph AVERAGE G LCM SWEEPS W	E ROP. ROP. VITH 25 ppb LCM	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD		
	I_								<b>.</b>		•	<b>1</b>		



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/10/2016 Report Number: 21 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18

Drilling Days: 14
End MD (ftKB): 13,955 Depth Progress (ft): 1,596 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 5,070 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SU 10, SECT 6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK Latitude	2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI I 2,559.00		County REAGAN	Stat TEX	
Report Summary									
	otal Depth Date	Rig Release Date	Target Form				Pro	oposed TD (ftKB)	40.705
3/15/2016			WFMPD_41	10_SH					18,725
Status at Report Time DRILLING LATERAL AT 13,955 ft.									
Operations Summary ROTATE/SLIDE CONTROLLED AT RIG. ROTATE/SLIDE CONTROLLE CHANGED OUT ROTATING HEAD IT TO 13,955 ft ( 380 ft AT 76 fph ). I SURVEY AT 13,796 ft , INC 89.8°, 19.2 LEFT MUD WT 11.8, VIS 59 BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 A UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WAL	D AT 175 FPH FROM 12,628 ft RUBBER. ROTATE/SLIDE C/ RUBIER. ROTATE/SLIDE C/ RUBIER FOR ROTA LZI 354.87°, TVD 8,382.39 ft., V T 16:30	TO 13,575 ft ( 947 ft AT 66.5 fph ) DNTROLLED AT 175 FPH FROM LOSSES VS 5,070.46 ft., DLS 1.09°, 2.7 ft A	RVICED DI ). 13,575 ABOVE,	Planned Operations RILL LATERAL SE	CTION TO PRO				
Start MD (ftKB)	12,359 End MD (ftKB)	Depth Proof	gress (ft)	1,59	Drilling Time (	(hr)	23.00	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	69.4
Time Log									
Start         End         Dur         Start Dep           Time         Time         (hr)         (ftKB)	h End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	DUCTION LAT	TEDAL EDOM	Hole Section		Category	Activity DRILL W/ MUD	NPT

Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	(ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
	08:45	3.75	12,359		ROTATE/SLIDE CONTROL DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 12,359 ft TO 12,628 ft = 269 ft AT 71.7 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 219 ft IN 2.50 HOURS, 87.6 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 50 ft IN 1.25 HOURS, 33.3 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE 88%, SLIDE 12%  (FULL RETURNS)  CONTROL DRILL AT 175 fph, PUMPING LCM SWEEPS WITH 25 ppb LCM INCREASE PUMP RATE AND ROP AS WELLBORE ALLOWED  **TARGET LINE CHANGE AT 6:00- TL 5: 8,434 'KBTVD @ 0' VS w/90.70 INC.**	PROD		DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
08:45	09:15	0.50	12,628	12,628	RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
09:15	23:30	14.25	12,628	13,575	ROTATE/SLIDE CONTROL DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 12,628 ft TO 13,575 ft = 947 ft AT 66.5 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 807 ft IN 9.25 HOURS, 87.2 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 140 ft IN 5 HOURS, 28 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE 85%, SLIDE 15% (FULL RETURNS) CONTROL DRILL AT 175 fph, PUMPING LCM SWEEPS WITH 25 ppb LCM INCREASE PUMP RATE AND ROP AS WELLBORE ALLOWED  **H2S DRILL AT 17:45, MANNED IN 2 MIN. 30 SEC.**	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
23:30	00:00	0.50	13,575	13,575	CHANGED OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBER	PROD	LAT	DRILL	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD	Yes
00:00	05:00	5.00	13,575	13,955	ROTATE/SLIDE CONTROL DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 13,575 ft TO 13,955 ft = 380 ft AT 76 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 260 ft IN 2 HOURS, 130 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 120 ft IN 3 HOURS, 40 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE 68%, SLIDE 32% (FULL RETURNS) CONTROL DRILL AT 175 fph, PUMPING LCM SWEEPS WITH 25 ppb LCM INCREASE PUMP RATE AND ROP AS WELLBORE ALLOWED	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/11/2016 Report Number: 22 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 15 End MD (ftKB): 15,490 Depth Progress (ft): 1,535 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 6,581 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0				RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.28	74000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00	RKB (ft) 21.00	County REAGAN			State TEXAS	
Repo	rt Sun	nmary	1													
Well Sp	oud Date		To	otal Depth Date	Э	Rig Release Date		Target For					Propos	ed TD (ftKB)		
- · ·		/2016					١	NFMPD_4	410_SH							18,725
	at Report		15.490 ft													
			10,400 11						Planned Operations							
Operations Summary																
Start M	D (ftKB)			End I	MD (ftKB)		epth Progre	ess (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg	ROP (ft/hr)		
				13,955		15,490			1,53	5		2	23.50			65.3
Time	Log															
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	h End Depth (ftKB)		Coi	mments			Hole Sect	on Interval	Categ	jory	Activity		NPT
05:00	09:45	4.75	13,955	5 14,238	14,238 ft = 283 i ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 6 ROTATE 92%, S ( FULL RETURN	: 218 ft IN 2.50 HOURS, 65 ft IN 2.25 HOURS, 28. SLIDE 08% NS ) bbl LCM SWEEPS PER S	87.2 fph AV 9 fph AVER	ERAGE F	ROP. P.	PROD	LAT	DRILL		DRILL W/ MUD		
09:45	10:15	0.50	14,238	14,238		GREASE AND CHECK I ERVICE TOPDRIVE.	FLUID LEVE	ELS ON D	PRILLING	PROD	LAT	DRILL	ŀ	LUBRICATE RIG		
10:15	05:00	18.75	14,238	3 15,490	15,490 ft = 1252 ROTATE DRILL: SLIDE DRILL: 1 ROTATE 88%, S (FULL RETURN PUMPING 20 b COTTONSEED	: 1107 ft IN 10.75 HOUR: 145 ft IN 8 HOURS, 18.1 SLIDE 12% NS ) IbI LCM SWEEPS PER :	S, 103 fph <i>I</i> fph AVERA STAND WIT	AVERAGE GE ROP.	E ROP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	1	DRILL W/ MUD		
					( FULL RETURN PUMPING 20 b COTTONSEED	NS) NDI LCM SWEEPS PER : HULLS		'H 20 ppb	CEDAR FIBER AND							



API

## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/12/2016 Report Number: 23

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 16 End MD (ftKB): 17,082 Depth Progress (ft): 1,592 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 8,255 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	2383395950000 UNIVERSITY LAN 10, SECT 6				74000000		Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
Report Summary												
Well Spud Date To 3/15/2016	otal Depti	h Date	Rig Release Date		Target For WFMPD_4				F	Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,7	725
Status at Report Time DRILLING LATERAL AT 17,082 ft												
Operations Summary ROTATE/SLIDE 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTI SERVICED RIG. ROTATE/SLIDE 8 3 AT 73.7 fph ). CHANGED OUT ROT LATERAL FROM 16,893 ft TO 17,08: LOSSES SURVEY AT 16,925 ft , INC 89.6°, A: RIGHT MUD WT 11.8, VIS 57 BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 AT UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WALK	3/4 in. PI FATING F 32 ft ( 189 ZI 2.5°, <sup>-</sup> - 16:30	RODUCTION LATERAL HEAD RUBBER. ROTA 9 ft AT 63 fph ). MIXING	. FROM 15,658 ft TO 1 TE/SLIDE 8 3/4 in. PR( 6 LCM IN SWEEPS TO 193.20 ft., DLS 1.28°, 2	16,893 ft (123 ODUCTION ) PREVENT 2.4 ft BELOV	35 ft V, 4.1	Planned Operations DRILL LATERAL SE		OPOSED TD (	DF 18,725 ft.			
Start MD (ftKB)	15,490	End MD (ftKB)	17,082	Depth Progre	ess (ft)	1,59	Drilling Time	(hr)	23.0	Avg ROP (ft/hr)	60	9.2

Time	Log									
Start	End			End Depth						
Time	Time	(hr)	(ftKB)	(ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	08:15	3.25	15,490	15,658	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 15,490 ft TO 15,658 ft = 168 ft AT 51.7 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 134 ft IN 1.50 HOURS, 89.3 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 34 ft IN 1.75 HOURS, 19.4 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE 80%, SLIDE 20% (FULL RETURNS) PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
08:15	08:45	0.50	15,658	15,658	RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
08:45	01:30	16.75	15,658	16,893	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 15,658 ft TO 16,893 ft = 1235 ft AT 73.7 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 1155 ft IN 11.75 HOURS, 98.3 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 80 ft IN 5 HOURS, 16 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE 94%, SLIDE 6% (FULL RETURNS) PUMPING 20 bb1 LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS  *BOP DRILL AT 13:00, MANNED IN 1 MINUTE** *H2S DRILL AT 17:45, MANNED IN 2 MINUTES AND 40 SECONDS*	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
01:30	02:00	0.50	16,893	16,893	CHANGED OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBER	PROD	LAT	DRILL	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD	Yes
02:00	05:00	3.00	16,893	17,082	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 16,893 ft TO 17,082 ft = 189 ft AT 63 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 179 ft IN 2 HOURS, 89.5 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 10 ft IN 1 HOURS, 10 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE 95%, SLIDE 5% (FULL RETURNS) PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	



## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/13/2016 Report Number: 24

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 17 End MD (ftKB): 17,850 Depth Progress (ft): 768 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,010 AFE Number: 1550336

42383395950000 U					Legal Location SITY LANDS SURVEY, A-U212, BLOCK T 6	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI RI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Repo	rt Sun	nmary										
		/2016	To	tal Depth Dat	e Rig Release Date	Target For WFMPD_4					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
	at Report		47.050.6									
	ons Sum		17,850 ft				Planned Operations					
PRODU PRODU ON PAS LATERA LOSSE SURVE LEFT MUD W BIG RIG	E/SLIDE E SHOO JCTION I SON TEC AL FROM S Y AT 17, 'T 11.8, \ G SPUD	8 3/4 in. DT PASO LATERAL CH. LOG // 17,461 .681 ft , I //S 57 DATE ; 3	N DUE TO _ FROM 17, GED HOLE ft TO 17,85	LIGHTNING S 391 ft TO 17, FROM 17,39, 0 ft (389 ft AT ZI 2.5°, TVD 8	FROM 17,082 ft TO 17,391 ft (309 ft AT TRIKE NEAR RIG. ROTATE/SLIDE 8 3/4 461 ft (70 ft AT 93.3 fph). CIRCULATE V 2 ft TO 17,461 ft. ROTATE/SLIDE 8 3/4 32.4 fph). MIXING LCM IN SWEEPS TO 3,388.38 ft., VS 8,948.48 ft., DLS 1.72°, 3	41.2 fph). I in. VHILE WAITING in. PRODUCTION D PREVENT	DRILL LATERAL SE	CTION TO PROP	OSED TD	OF 18,725 ft.		
Start M	D (ftKB)					Depth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time (h	r)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
Time	Log			17,082	17,850		76	3		20	0.25	37.9
Time Start	End	Dur	Start Dent	n End Depth								
Time	Time	(hr)	(ftKB)	(ftKB)		mments		Hole Section	Interval	Catego	ry Activity	NPT
05:00	12:30	7.50	17,082	2 17,391	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODL 17,391 ft = 309 ft AT 41.2 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 259 ft IN 4 HOURS, 64 SLIDE DRILL: 259 ft IN 3.5 HOURS, 14.3 ROTATE 84%, SLIDE 16% (FULL RETURNS)  PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS  **TARGET LINE CHANGE AT 12:15= TI INC.**	.8 fph AVERAGE ROF. 3 fph AVERAGE ROP. STAND WITH 15 ppb	CEDAR FIBER AND	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
12:30	13:30	1.00	17,39	17.391	TOUBLE SHOOT PASON SYSTEM AF	TER LIGHTING STRI	KE NEAR RIG	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DIRECTIONAL WO	rk
13:30	14:15	0.75	17,39 <sup>-</sup>		ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODU 17,461 ft = 70 ft AT 93.3 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 70 ft IN 0.75 HOURS, 9 SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft IN 0 HOURS, 0 fph A ROTATE 100%, SLIDE 0% (FULL RETURNS) PUMPING 20 bbi LOM SWEEPS PER 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS	JCTION LATERAL FR 03.3 fph AVERAGE RO AVERAGE ROP.	OM 17,391 ft TO OP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
14:15	16:00	1.75	17,461	17,461	CIRCULATE FOR CLEAN-UP CYCLE V WORKING STAND AND CIRCULATING			PROD	LAT	DRILL	3rd PARTY EQUIPM REPAIR	MENT Yes
16:00	16:30	0.50	17,461	17,461	RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.	FLUID LEVELS ON D	PRILLING	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	Yes
16:30	17:00	0.50	17,46	17,461	LOGGED HOLE FROM 17,392 ft TO 17	•		PROD	LAT	DRILL	DIRECTIONAL WO	RK Yes
17:00	05:00	12.00	17,46	17,850	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODIC CAPACITY WITH 1 PUMP AT 470 gpm 17,461 ft TO 17,850 ft = 389 ft AT 32.4 ft ROTATE DRILL: 328 ft IN 6.25 HOURS, SUIDE DRILL: 61 ft IN 5.75 HOURS, 10 ROTATE 84%, SLIDE 16% (FULL RETURNS) PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS (TRACTION MOTOR ON #2 PUMP BU STRIKE)	AND CONTROLLED A ph. 52.5 fph AVERAGE F .6 fph AVERAGE ROI STAND WITH 15 ppb	AT 75 fph FROM ROP. P. CEDAR FIBER AND	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	Yes



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/14/2016 Report Number: 25

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 18 End MD (ftKB): 18,628 Depth Progress (ft): 771 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,803 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SUR 10, SECT 6	VEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.28	374000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00	` '	County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
Report Summary											
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Fotal Depth Date 4/13/2016	Rig Release Date		Target For WFMPD_4					Proposed TD (ftKB)		18,725
Status at Report Time PERFORMING CLEANUP CYCLE.	. RAISING MUD WEIGHT.										
Operations Summary ROTATE/SLIDE 8 3/4 in. PRODUC HOUR CHANGING ROTATING HE 18,122 ft TO 18,402 ft (280 ft AT 56 LATERAL FROM 18,402 ft TO 18,6 RAISED MW. MIXING LCM IN SWE SURVEY AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6°, 5.1 LEFT MUD WT 12.0, VIS 57 IN/ MW 11.9 BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 A	AD SEAL, ROTATE/SLIDÉ 8 3/4 6 fph). SERVICED RIG. ROTATE 128 ft (226 ft AT 64.6 fph). PERF(EEPS TO PREVENT LOSSES.  AZI 359.5°, TVD 8,389.72 ft., VS  VIS 56 OUT	in. PRODUCTION LATE E/SLIDE 8 3/4 in. PRODU DRMED CLEAN UP CYC	ERAL FŔC UCTION CLE AND	1/2 DM		CYCLE AND F LS. PULL WE			POUT OF HOLE AND LAY ING CREW AND RUN 5 1/2		
UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WAL Start MD (ftKB)	_K)  I End MD (ftKB)	In	enth Progr	occ (ft)		Drilling Time	\ (hr)		Ava ROP (ft/hr)		

Start M	D (ftKB)					Drilling Time (h	r)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	50.0
Time	Log	_		17,850	18,628 771			15.25		50.6
Start	End	Dur	Start Denth	End Depth				1		
Time	Time	(hr)	(ftKB)	(ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	11:30	6.50	17,850	18,060	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL WITH DEMINISHED CAPACITY WITH 1 PUMP AT 470 gpm AND CONTROLLED AT 75 fph FROM 17,850 ft TO 18,060 ft = 210 ft AT 32.3 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 157 ft IN 3 HOURS, 52.3 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 53 ft IN 3.5 HOURS, 15.1 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE 74.7%, SLIDE 25.3%  (FULL RETURNS)  PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS  (TRACTION MOTOR ON #2 PUMP BURNED UP DUE TO LIGHTNING STRIKE)	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	Yes
11:30	12:00	0.50	18,060	18,122	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 18,060 ft TO 18,122 ft = 62 ft AT 124 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 62 ft iN .5 HOURS, 124 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft iN 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE 100%, SLIDE 0%  (FULL RETURNS)  PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS  (BOTH PUMPS BACK ON HOLE)	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
12:00	12:30	0.50	18,122	18,122	CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD SEAL.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	3rd PARTY EQUIPMENT REPAIR	Yes
12:30	17:30	5.00	18,122	18,402	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 18,122 ft TO 18,402 ft = 280 ft AT 56 fph.  ROTATE DRILL: 260 ft In 3 HOURS, 86.7 fph AVERAGE ROP.  SLIDE DRILL: 20 ft In 2 HOURS, 10 fph AVERAGE ROP.  ROTATE 93%, SLIDE 7%  (FULL RETURNS)  PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS  (BOTH PUMPS BACK ON HOLE)	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
17:30	18:00	0.50	18,402	18,402	RIG SERVICE: GREASE AND CHECK FLUID LEVELS ON DRILLING EQUIPMENT. SERVICE TOPDRIVE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
18:00	21:30	3.50	18,402	18,628	ROTATE/SLIDE DRILL 8 3/4 in. PRODUCTION LATERAL FROM 18,402 ft TO 18,628 ft = 226 ft AT 64.6 fph. ROTATE DRILL: 226 ft in 3.5 HOURS, 64.6 fph AVERAGE ROP. SLIDE DRILL: 0 ft in 0 HOURS, 0 fph AVERAGE ROP. ROTATE 100%, SLIDE 0% (FULL RETURNS) PUMPING 20 bbi LCM SWEEPS PER STAND WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS (BOTH PUMPS BACK ON HOLE) *TD WELL AT 18,628ft ON 4-13-16 AT 21:30. 51ft FROM HARD LINE.*	PROD	LAT	DRILL	DRILL W/ MUD	
21:30	05:00	7.50	18,628	18,628	PERFORMED CLEAN UP CYCLE. TOPDRIVE AT 70 RPM, 540 GPM. PUMPED 2 - 40 BBL HI-VIS SWEEPS, AND 2 - 40 BBL WEIGHTED SWEEPS: 1ST BOTTOMS UP: 85% SHAKER SCREEN COVERAGE; STARTING TQ 14,000, ENDING TQ 13,000.  2ND BOTTOMS UP: 60% SHAKER SCREEN COVERAGE; STARTING TQ 14,000, ENDING TQ 12,000.  3RD BOTTOMS UP: 50% SHAKER SCREEN COVERAGE; STARTING TQ 12,000, ENDING TQ 11,000.  4TH BOTTOMS UP: 30% SHAKER SCREEN COVERAGE; STARTING TQ 11,000, ENDING TQ 10,000.  STARTED RAISING MW 1 TENTH Ib PER CIRCULATION AFTER THIRD BOTTOMS UP: PUMPING 20 bbl SWEEPS W/ 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTOMSED HULLS EVERY 2 HOURS TO PREVENT SEEPAGE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	



#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Report End Date: 4/15/2016

Report Number: 26 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 19 End MD (ftKB): 18,628

Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,803 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	39595000	00			Legal Location SITY LANDS SUF T 6	RVEY, A-U21	2, BLOCK	Latitude 31.287	4000000		Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN			State TEXAS	
Repo	ort Sur	mmary	,	10, 020													
Well S	pud Date 3/15	e 5/2016	Tota	al Depth Date 4/13/	e /2016	Rig Release	e Date		arget For /FMPD_4					Propose	ed TD (ftKB)		18,725
			E AT 8000 ft			•											
Status at Report Time TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE AT 8000 ft Operations Summary RAISING MUD WEIGHT FROM 12.0 TO 12.4+, WITH 12.4+ HOLE STARTED SEEPING, SLOW DOWN PUMPS FROM 450 gpm TO 250 gpm, LOST @ 64 BBLS,BUILD AND PUMP 80 BBL LCM SWEEP, CIRCULATE AND LOWER MUD WEIGHT TO 12.0 ppg, MIX 10 ppb CEDAR FIBER IN SYSTEM w/12.0 PPG MUD WEIGHT. BUILT VOLUME AND MIXED 10 ppb LCM IN PITS. PUMPED OUT OF PITS AT 19: gpm WITH NO RETURNS. LOST 137 bbls. TRIPPED OUT OF HOLE FROM 18,628 ft TO 8000 ft.  SURVEY AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6°, AZI 359.5°, TVD 8,389.72 ft., VS 9,795.66 ft., DLS 1.19°, 3.8 ft ABOVE 5.1 LEFT MUD WT 12.0, VIS 57 IN/ MW 11.9 VIS 56 OUT  BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 AT 16:30 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WALK)										Planned Operations TRIP OUT OF HOLE MIX AND PUMP 100 HOLE. ATTEMPT TO LAY DOWN DIRECT	E TO 7300 ft. E bbi 30 ppb LC ) Achieve FL IONAL TOOLS	CM PILL AND : JLL RETURNS 3. TRIP IN HO	SPOT ACROS	SS LOSS LATE FOF LLER COI	ŻÓNE. LET PILL S R TRIP. TRIP OUT NE BIT TO CLEAN	OF HOLE T	_
Start MD (ftKB)         End MD (ftKB)         Depth Progress           18,628         18,628									ss (ft)	1	Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg I	ROP (ft/hr)		
Time Log																	
Start         End Time         Dur (ftr)         Start Depth (ftr)         End Depth (ftr)         Comments										Hole Sect	ion Interval	Catego	ory	Activity		NPT	
05.00	145.00	Time (nr) (ttkB) (ttkB) Comments								2 00 LLLOWEEDO	DDOD	1.4-	DDII I		OND MUD O OID	_	

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	15:30	10.50	18,628		CIRCULATING, WEIGHT UP FROM 12.0 TO 12.4+. PUMPED 20 bbl SWEEPS WITH 15 ppb CEDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS 2.5 Ppb WEDDAR FIBER AND 5 ppb COTTONSEED HULLS 2.5 Ppg MW GOING IN AND 12.3 ppg MW COMING OUT. REDUCED PUMP RATE TO 240 gpm WITH PARTIAL RETURNS. REDUCED PUMP RATE TO 170 gpm WITH PARTIAL RETURNS. REDUCED PUMP RATE TO 170 gpm WITH PARTIAL RETURNS. REDUCED PUMP RATE TO 140 gpm WITH PARTIAL RETURNS.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
15:30	18:30	3.00	18,628		SHUT DOWN PUMP AND BUILT VOLUME FROM RESERVE MUD. MIXED 10 ppb LCM IN ACTIVE SYSTEM.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
18:30	19:30	1.00	18,628	18,628	PUMPED OUT OF ACTIVE SYSTEM WITH 10 ppb LCM AT 195 gpm. NO RETURNS. LOST 137 bbls MUD.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
19:30	05:00	9.50	18,628	18,628	PULLED ROTATING HEAD RUBBER AND PUMPED 20 bbis DOWN BACKSIDE. HOLE DID NOT FILL AND COULD NOT SEE FLUID LEVEL. LAID DOWN 2 JOINTS HWDP AND TRIPPED OUT OF HOLE WET AT 90 fpm FROM 18,628 ft TO 8000 ft ( HOLE TIGHT FROM 18,300 ft TO 17,670 ft, AND AT 8430 ft ) ( PULLED UP TO 50k OVER TO WORK THROUGH TIGHT SPOTS ). PUMPED 5 bbis DOWN BACKSIDE EVERY 5 STANDS. HOLE DID NOT FILL UP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	



API 42383395950000

## AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary

#### UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122

Longitude -101.4714300000

Latitude 31.2874000000

Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SURVEY, A-U212, BLOCK 10, SECT 6 Orig KB EI... RKB (ft)

2,559.00

t) County 21.00 REAGAN

Report End Date: 4/16/2016 Report Number: 27

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 20 End MD (ftKB): 18,628 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930

Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,803 AFE Number: 1550336

> State TEXAS

					12. 2.		-						
3/15/	/2016	Tota			Rig Release Date					Pr	Proposed TD (ftKB) 18,72		
		H INSERT BI	T AT 2842 ft										
UT OF H JGHOUT 25 bbls. LE FROM IT TO 11.	IOLÉ TO PITS. P CIRCUL M 7234 ft 9 ppg. F	UMPED DOV LATED AT 250 I TO BHA. LA PUMPED THE	VN DRILL PI O gpm WITH ND DOWN B ROUGH BOT	PE OUT OF ACT FULL RETURNS HA. MOVED 40 I TH PUMPS AND	TIVE SYSTEM AND S. PUMPED SLUG A bbls CLEAN MUD TO TOP DRIVE WITH (	GOT CIRCU AND TRIPPEI O SLUG TAN	ilation D out IK and	Planned Operations TRIP IN HOLE TO SH TO BOTTOM. CIRCUL	OE. BREAK CIF	RCULATIO	N. WASH AND RETRIP OUT OF HO	EAM THROUGH CURVE. TRIP LE TO RUN CASING.	IN HOLE
T				0 8,389.72 ft., VS	S 9,795.66 ft., DLS 1	.19°, 3.8 ft AE	BOVE,						
	RE 0606	, ,	End I	MD (ftKB)	40.00		gress (ft)		Drilling Time (hr	)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
Log			18,628		18,62	28		0					
End	Dur (hr)					Comments			Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
06:00	1.00	18,628	18,628	l		6/8 CASING S			PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	INI I
18:30	2.25	18,628		BBLS IN SLUG STARTED PUM AFTER PUMPIN	TANK W/30 ppb LCI PING DOWN DRILL NG 25 bbls, GOT RE	M. . PIPE OUT C ETURNS. CIR	OF ACTIVE S	SYSTEM AND	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
23:00	4.50	18,628	18,628	CHECKED FOR	R FLOW ( WELL STA	ATIC ). TRIPP			PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
02:00	3.00	18,628	18,628	LAID DOWN BH	HA #6 FROM 172 ft T	TO SURFACE	GRADED	BIT No. 6	PROD	LAT	DRILL	P/U & L/D BHA	
02:30 03:30	0.50 1.00	18,628 18,628		CLEANED OFF MOVED 40 bbls	RIG FLOOR CLEAN MUD FROI	M FRAC TANI	K TO SLUG	GING PIT, AND	PROD PROD	LAT LAT	DRILL DRILL	TRIPS COND MUD & CIRC	
05:00	1.50	18,628	18,628	DRIVE. MADE UP XO S	SUB, BIT SUB, AND	8 3/4 INSERT	Γ BIT AND T	TRIPPED IN HOLE	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
	Dud Date 3/15, at Report NG IN HC IN HCH IN HC IN HCH IN HC IN HC IN HC IN HC IN HC IN HCH	avid Date	3/15/2016  at Report Time NG IN HOLE WITH INSERT BI ions Summary UT OF HOLE TO 7234 ft. BUI JGHOUT PITS. PUMPED DOV 25 bbls. CIRCULATED AT 25/ LE FROM 7234 ft TO BHA. L. IT TO 11.9 ppg. PUMPED THI LLER CONE BIT AND BIT SUE AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6°, AZ TO TO 11.9 ppg. PUMPED THI LLER CONE BIT AND BIT SUE AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6°, AZ TO TO 12.0, VIS 57 IN/ MW 11.9 VI CONE BIT AND BIT SUE AND THE SERVICE STATE OF THE SERVICE STATE AND DITE STATE OF THE SERVICE STATE AND THE SERVICE THE SE	Total Depth Date   3/15/2016   Total Depth Date   3/15/2016   4/13/2016   4/	Total Depth Date   3/15/2016   at Report Time   NG IN HOLE WITH INSERT BIT AT 2842 ft	Total Depth Date   3/15/2016   Rig Release Date   3/15/2016   Alt Depth Date   4/13/2016   Rig Release Date   3/15/2016   Alt Report Time	Total Depth Date   3/15/2016   At 19/2016   At 19/2016   At Report Time	Total Depth Date   A/13/2016   Rig Release Date   Target Found For Stripped   Transport Found For Found For Found	Date   3/15/2016	Total Depth Date   A/13/2016   Total Depth Date   A/13/2016   Rig Release Date   Target Formation   A/13/2016   A/13/2016	Date   3/15/2016   Total Depth Date   3/15/2016   Rig Release Date   Target Formation   Target Formation   3/15/2016   Rig Release Date   Target Formation   Target	Total Depth Date	Total Depth Date   Total Depth Date   Rig Release Date   Target Formation   Proposed TD (RKB)



Surface Legal Location

## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Longitude

Latitude

Report End Date: 4/17/2016 Report Number: 28

Orig KB EI... RKB (ft) County

Rig: UNIT, 407 Projected Days (days): 18

Drilling Days: 21 End MD (ftKB): 18,628 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,894 AFE Number: 1550336

State

42383395950000	UNIVERSITY LANDS SI 10, SECT 6	URVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	31.2874000000	-101.4714300000	2,559.00	21.00	REAGAN		TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total Depth Date 4/13/2016	Rig Release Date	Target Fo WFMPD_					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time WASHING AND REAMING AT 13	.575 ft.	•	·						
Operations Summary TRIPPED IN HOLE TO 7202 ft, S REPLACE BLOWN HYDRAULIC 7202 ft TO 8970 ft, W/250 gpm, 2 HOLE FROM 8970 ft TO 10,826 f DUE TO SEVERE WEATHER. CI WASHED AND REAMED FROM 1 SURVEY AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6° 5.1 LEFT MUD WT 12.0, VIS 57 IN/ MW 11. BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WA	HOSE ON TOP DRIVE, CHAN, 20 ROTARY (FULL RETURNS), 1t. CLEANED LCM OUT OF MU LEANED LCM OUT OF MUD PI 0,826 ft TO 13,575 ft. , AZI 359.5°, TVD 8,389.72 ft., \ 9 VIS 56 OUT  AT 16:30 LLK)	GED 2 VALVE SEATS IN # CIRCULATE AND MIX LC D PUMPS. SHUT DOWN UMPS. CIRCULATED AT 1 VS 9,795.66 ft., DLS 1.19°,	HEAD, 1 PUMP, WASH M. TRIPPED IN OPERATIONS 95 gpm.  3.8 ft ABOVE,	Planned Operations WASH AND REAM F OF HOLE TO RUN 5	1/2 PRÓDUCT	fion Casing		HOLE CLEAN FOR TRIP (	OUT. TRIP OUT
Start MD (ftKB)	End MD (ftKB) 18,628	18,628	epth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	08:15	3.25	18,628	18,628	TRIP IN HOLE TO 7202 ft.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
08:15	09:30	1.25	18,628	18,628	SLIP AND CUT 110' OF DRILL LINE	PROD	LAT	DRILL	CUT SLIP & DRILL LINE	
09:30	10:00	0.50	18,628	18,628	ROUTINE RIG SERVICE	PROD	LAT	DRILL	LUBRICATE RIG	
10:00	10:30	0.50	18,628	18,628	INSTALL ROTATING HEAD,	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
10:30	11:00	0.50	18,628	18,628	REPLACE BLOWN HYDRAULIC HOSE ON TOP DRIVE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
11:00	13:00	2.00	18,628	18,628	CHANGE 2 VALVE SEATS IN #1 PUMP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
13:00	15:30	2.50	18,628	18,628	WASH 7202 ft TO 8970 ft, W/250 gpm, 20 ROTARY (FULL RETURNS)	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REAMING	
15:30	16:30	1.00	18,628	18,628	CIRCULATE. MIX LCM.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
16:30	18:00	1.50	18,628	18,628	TIH 8970 ft TO 10826 ft.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
18:00	21:00	3.00	18,628		ATTEMPTED TO CIRCULATE. PUMPS WOULD NOT PUMP. CLEANED LCM OUT FROM UNDER VALVES IN PUMPS. ATTEMPTED TO CIRCULATE WITH #2 PUMP. PUMPED GOOD FOR A MINUTE THEN QUIT PUMPING. BACK FLUSHED THROUGH CHARGING PUMPS AND SUCTION LINES. ATTEMPTED TO CIRCULATE AND PUMPS WOULD NOT PUMP MUD DOWN DRILL PIPE. CIRCULATED WITH MIXING PUMP THROUGH LOW PRESSURE LINE THROUGHOUT PITS TO REDUCE THE CONCENTRATION OF LCM IN THE SUCTION PIT.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
21:00	22:30	1.50	18,628	18,628	SHUT OPERATIONS DOWN DUE TO SEVERE WEATHER.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	SAFETY MEETING	Yes
22:30	23:30	1.00	18,628	18,628	CLEANED LCM OUT OF #2 PUMP	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes
23:30	00:30	1.00	18,628		CIRCULATED WELL AT 195 gpm WITH #2 PUMP WHILE CLEANING LCM OUT OF #1 PUMP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
00:30	05:00	4.50	18,628	18,628	WASHED AND REAMED FROM 10,826 ft TO 13,575 ft PUMPING 195 gpm AND 20 rpm ON DP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REAMING	



#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/18/2016 Report Number: 29

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 22 End MD (ftKB): 18,628 Depth Progress (ft): 0

Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,894 AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SUF 10, SECT 6	RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.28	374000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
Report Summary											
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total D	epth Date 4/13/2016	Rig Release Date		Target For WFMPD_4					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time CLEANING LCM OUT OF MUD P	UMPS										
Operations Summary WASHED AND REAMED FROM MUD WEIGHT 12.0 ppg/10 ppb L 18,628 ft TO 18,052 ft. PUMPED SLUG AND ATTEMPTED TO TRII DRIVE TO CIRCULATE. HOLE P. CIRCULATED HOLE CLEAN. PUI 16,950 ft. HOLE PACKED OFF. V PUMPS SURVEY AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6° 5.1 LEFT MUD WT 12.0, VIS 70 IN/ MW 11. BIG RIG SPUD DATE ; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WA	CM. PL OUT OF POUT OF ACKED MPED C VORKED AZI 35 9 VIS 68 AT 16:3	JIMPED OUT OF HOLE A F HOLE 4 STANDS DP FF DF HOLE. HOLE TIGHT. OFF. WORKED PIPE A DUT OF HOLE WITH 250 D PIPE AND ROTATED TO 9.5°, TVD 8,389.72 ft., VS 8 OUT	NĎ LAID DOWN 18 JTS ROM 18,052 ft TO 17,67 SCREWED INTO PIPE ' ND ESTABLISHED CIRC gpm AND 40 rpm FROI O GET RETURNS. WOI	HWDP FROM THE PROPERTY OF T	TAIN OM ED TO MUD	Planned Operations BACK REAM OUT C PRODUCTION CASI	F HOLE. PUL	L WEAR BUSI	HING. RIG UF	CASING CREW AND RUN	J 5 1/2
Start MD (ftKB)	18,6	End MD (ftKB)	18,628	Depth Progr	ess (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
Time Log	10,0	220	10,020				<u> </u>				
0											

Time	Log									
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)	Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	14:00	9.00	18,628	18,628	WASHED AND REAMED FROM 13,575 ft TO 18,628 ft PUMPING 195 gpm AND 20 rpm ON DP.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REAMING	
14:00	19:00	5.00	18,628	18,628	CIRCULATE, MAINTAIN MUD WEIGHT 12.0 ppg, 10 ppb LCM	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
19:00	21:00	2.00	18,628	18,628	PUMPED OUT AND LAID DOWN 18 JOINTS HWDP FROM 18,628 ft TO 18,052 ft.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
21:00	21:30	0.50	18,628	18,628	PUMPED OUT 4 STANDS DP FROM 18,052 ft TO 17,673 ft.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
21:30	22:00	0.50	18,628	18,628	CHECKED FOR FLOW ( WELL STATIC ). PUMPED SLUG AND ATTEMPTED TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE. HOLE TIGHT. ATTEMPTED TO WORK THROUGH TIGHT HOLE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS	
22:00	01:30	3.50	18,628	18,628	SCREWED INTO DP WITH TOP DRIVE AND ATTEMPTED TO CIRCULATE AT 17,631 ft (HOLE PACKED OFF). ROTATED AT 30 rpm AND WORKED PIPE. BROUGHT PUMP UP AND HOLE STILL PACKED OFF. WORKED PIPE WITHOUT PUMPING WITH 30 RPM UNTIL TORQUE AND TRAPPED PRESSURE DROPPED OFF. BROUGHT PUMP UP AT 115 gpm AND ESTABLISHED CIRCULATION. STAGED PUMP UP TO 250 gpm AND CIRCULATED WHILE WORKING PIPE UP AND DOWN 90 ft WITH 40 rpm TO CLEAN HOLE.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
01:30	03:00	1.50	18,628	18,628	BACK REAM OUT OF HOLE FROM 17,631 ft TO 16,950 ft WITH 250 gpm AND 40 rpm. HOLE PACKED OFF AT 16,950 ft.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REAMING	
03:00	04:30	1.50	18,628	18,628	WORKED PIPE AND ROTATED TO RELEASE TRAPPED PRESSURE.STARTED GETTING RETURNS AND PUMP QUIT PUMPING DUE TO LCM. SWITCHED TO #1 PUMP AND IT WOULD NOT PUMP FLUID.	PROD	LAT	DRILL	COND MUD & CIRC	
04:30	05:00	0.50	18.628	18.628	CLEAN LCM OUT OF MUD PUMPS	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REPAIR RIG	Yes



## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/19/2016

Report Number: 30 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 23 End MD (ftKB): 18,628

Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,894 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	9595000	0				RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.287400000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
Repo	rt Sur	nmary												
		/2016	Tota	I Depth Date 4/13/		Rig Release Date	Target Fo WFMPD_				F	Proposed TD (ftKB)		18,725
	at Repor		3-110 LTC CA	SING AT 20	14 ft									
Operati WORK FROM OFF FI EQUIP	ons Sum TIGHT S 13,945 ft LOOR AN MENT AN	nmary SPOT FR TO SUR ND CHAN ND BPS S	OM 16,992 ft RFACE. BROK NGED SAVER SUBS AND RA	TO 16,907 f (E OFF BIT SUB. HSM AN 44 JTS C	t. BACKREAM F AND BIT SUB. F AND RIGGED U OF CASING TO 2	ROM 16907 ft TO 13,94: PULLED WEAR BUSHIN P CASING CREW. MAD 1014 ft. 15 9,795.66 ft., DLS 1.19°	G. CLEARED DE UP FLOAT	Planned Operations RUN 5 1/2 PRODUC BOTTOMS UP. CEM		G TO 18,628 ft	t. Burst disk <i>f</i>	IND BLEED OUT AIR. C	IRCULATE 2	
5.1 LEF	·T		/ MW 11.9 VIS		) 8,389.72 π., VS	5 9,795.66 π., DLS 1.19°	, 3.8 π ΑΒΟVΕ,							
CONTA		MY WITH	TRRC AT 14	4:30 ON 4-18	8-16 ABOUT INT	ENT TO RUN PRODUC	CTION CASING							
			/27/2016 AT 1 6 HS (WALK)	6:30										
Start M	D (ftKB)		1	End N 8,628	MD (ftKB)	18,628	epth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)		
Time	Log			0,020		10,020			<u> </u>					
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)		0-	mments		Hole Sect	ion Interval	Category	Activity	,	NPT
05:00	13:30	8.50	18,628			SPOT FROM 16,992 ft T		EAM FROM 16,907 ft	PROD	LAT	DRILL	REAMING	/	INFI
13:30	00:30	11.00	18,628	18,628	POOH FROM 1	/250 gpm, 40 ROTARY. 3,945 ft TO SURFACE A NK. HOLE TOOK PROP	T 50 fpm. FILLED C	ONTINUOUSLY	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS		
00:30	01:00	0.50	18,628	18,628	PULLED WEAR		ER FILL.		PROD	LAT	DRILL	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD		
01:00	01:30	0.50	18,628	18,628	CLEARED OFF	RIG FLOOR AND CHA	NGED OUT SAVER	SUB ON TOP DRIVE	PROD	LAT	DRILL	TRIPS		
01:30 02:30	02:30 03:00	1.00 0.50	18,628 18,628		PRE JOB SAFE	SED UP EXPRESS CASI		EXPRESS CASING	PROD PROD	PROD PROD	CSG/CEMENT CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING SAFETY MEETING	3	
03:00	05:00	2.00	18,628	18,628	MADE UP FLOA	EW, TP, AND CO. MAN AT SHOE, FLOAT COLL 5 1/2 17# CYB-110 LTC			PROD	PROD	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING		



## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/20/2016 Report Number: 31 Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 24 End MD (ftKB): 18,628 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,894 AFE Number: 1550336

API 423833	95950000	)				RVEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.2874000000	Longitude -101.4714300000	Orig KB EI 2,559.00	RKB (ft) 21.00	County REAGAN		State TEXAS	
Repo	rt Sun	nmary		1,7										
Well Sp	oud Date		Tota	Depth Date		Rig Release Date	Target Fo				F	Proposed TD (ftKB)		
Status	3/15/ at Report			4/13/	/2016		WFMPD_	410_SH						18,725
	BTTM'S L							In.						
RUN 5	ons Sum 1/2 PRO LATE 2 B	DUČTIOI		D 18,628ft ,	SHOE SET AT 1	8618 ft BURST FLOTATI	ION COLLAR ,	Planned Operations FINISH CIRCULATIN		SET SLIP'S	, NIPPLE DOWN	I PREPARE TO WALK R	RIG	
CALLEI	D TRRC	ABOUT E	BOP TEST, TA	ALKED TO I	VY @ 12:00, EV	ERYTHING IS OK.								
5.1 LEF	T		NC 91.6°, AZI / MW 11.9 VIS		O 8,389.72 ft., V\$	S 9,795.66 ft., DLS 1.19°,	, 3.8 ft ABOVE,							
CONTA AND CE		MY WITH	I TRRC AT 14	4:30 ON 4-1	8-16 ABOUT IN	TENT TO RUN PRODUC	CTION CASING							
UNIVER			/27/2016 AT 1 6 HS (WALK)		MD (ftKB)	In	Depth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)		
JIAIT IVI	ה (וועם)		1	8,628	איי (ווועט)	18,628	popui Fiogress (ii)		Drilling Time	(111)		Avy NOF (IVIII)		
Time	Log													
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)		Cor	mments		Hole Section	on Interval	Category	Activity		NPT
05:00	23:00	18.00	18,628			ICLUDED 3 MARKER JO	OINTS) 5.5in, 17ppf, (		PROD	PROD	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING		INI" I
			·		PRODUCTION SHOE TRACK, FILLED CASING IN, AND LAID D 11,290 ft. TRIC, 18,570 ft, TRIC,	CSG MADE UP TO 4,62 FLOATS OPENED. AFT G ON THE FLY (PICKED DOWN TAG JOINT). 3 - N AN FLOAT SHOE AT 18,4 AN BPS SLEEVE AT 18,4 S SLEEVE AT 18,427 ft, 1	20 ft/lbs OPTIMUM TO FER INSTALLING FLO DUP TAG JOINT, TAC MARKER JTS AT 16, 618 ft. TRICAN FLO 523 ft, TRICAN BPS	ORQUE. FILLED OTATION COLLAR GGED BOTTOM 10 ft 151 ft, 13,719 ft, AT COLLAR AT SLEEVE AT 18,475						
23:00 23:30	23:30 05:00	0.50 5.50	18,628 18,628	18,628 18,628	RUPTURED DI	EMENTING HEAD AND V SK IN FLOTATION COLL BOTTOM'S UP (TEFLO	AR AT 1670 psi, AN	D BLED AIR OUT.	PROD PROD	PROD PROD	CSG/CEMENT CSG/CEMENT	RUN CASING RUN CASING		



## **AMERICAN ENERGY - PERMIAN BASIN, LLC UL Daily Drilling Partner Summary**

#### **UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0620HD AEPB WELL NO. 122**

Report End Date: 4/21/2016 Report Number: 32

Rig: UNIT, 407

Projected Days (days): 18 Drilling Days: 25 End MD (ftKB): 18,628 Depth Progress (ft): 0 Planned VS (ft): 9,930 Current VS (ft): 9,894

AFE Number: 1550336

API 42383395950000	Surface Legal Location UNIVERSITY LANDS SUR 10, SECT 6	VEY, A-U212, BLOCK	Latitude 31.287400000		Orig KB EI 2,559.00		County REAGAN		State TEXAS
Report Summary									
Well Spud Date 3/15/2016	Total Depth Date 4/13/2016	Rig Release Date 4/20/2016	Target Fo					Proposed TD (ftKB)	18,725
Status at Report Time RIG RELEASED AT 18:00 HRS			•					•	
Operations Summary FINISH CIRCULATING 2 BTTM'S REP. TEST CEMENT LINES TO 8 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT, CE WASH OUT CEMENTING EQUIP WASH THROUGH LINES AND B9 INSTALL TA CAP. RELEASE RIG  CALLED TRRC ABOUT BOP TES SURVEY AT 18,566 ft , INC 91.6° 5.1 LEFT MUD WT 12.0, VIS 70 IN/ MW 11.  CONTACTED AMY WITH TRRC AND CEMENT  BIG RIG SPUD DATE; 3/27/2016 UNIVERSITY 10 RE 0606 HS (WA	3500 psi, CEMENT 5 1/2 in PROI MENT PRESSURED OUT WITH MENT, RIG DOWN CEMENT EC OPS, NIPPLE DOWN BOPS, SET @ 18:00 ON 4/20/2016 ST, TALKED TO IVY @ 12:00, EVE , AZI 359.5°, TVD 8,389.72 ft., VS 9 VIS 68 OUT AT 14:30 ON 4-18-16 ABOUT INT AT 16:30	DUCTION CASING, LOS' 38 BBLS LEFT OF DISI IUIPMENT, CLEANING N I SLIPS, FINISH NIPPLE ERYTHING IS OK. 9,795.66 ft., DLS 1.19°,	T RETURNS 250 PLACEMENT, UID TANKS, DOWN.	Planned Operations RIG RELEASED TO		10 RE 0606 H	S		
Start MD (ftKB)	End MD (ftKB) 18,628	18,628	epth Progress (ft)		Drilling Time	(hr)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	

Start MI	D (ftKB)	' ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! !			` ,	1 ' ' '/	Drilling Time (hr	)		Avg ROP (ft/hr)	
				18,628	18,628	0					
Time	Log										
Start Time	End Time	Dur (hr)	Start Depth (ftKB)	End Depth (ftKB)		Comments	Hole Section	Interval	Category	Activity	NPT
05:00	06:30	1.50	18,628	18,628	FINISH CIRCULATING 2 BOTTOMS U	JP, HELD PJSM.	PROD	PROD	CSG/CEMENT	COND MUD & CIRC	
06:30	13:00	6.50	18,628	18,628	BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT, HAD 48 W/210 BBLS PUMPED, HELD 5 1/4 RATE UNTIL PRESSURE DISPLACEMENT, AT 390 BBLS INTO RATE, AT 399 BBLS INTO DISPLACE BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT PRESS BACK TO TANKS, PRESSURED UP RESULTS, WE HAD 38 BBLS LEFT T	W/10 ppb LCM. POZ H (1415 SKS) OZ H (2670 SKS) AR AND CPT-21 L , LOST RETURNS 250 500 psi PUMPING CEMENT @ 5 1/4 bpm  E STARTED CLIMBING @ 350 BBLS INTO DISPLACE HAD 6000 psi W3.5 bpm MENT PRESSURE WAS 7000 psi, W/404 URED OUT AT 8450 psi, BLED 11 BBLS TO 8450 psi AGAIN WITH SAME TO PUMP ON DISPLACEMENT, OADED PLUG AND NERF BALL, PUSHED	PROD	PROD	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CEMENT	
13:00	14:00	1.00	18,628	18,628	WASH OUT CEMENT EQUIPMENT,	RIG DOWN CEMENT EQUIPMENT.	PROD	PROD	CSG/CEMENT	RUN CEMENT	
14:00	18:00	4.00	18,628	18,628	FLUSH OUT LINES AND BOPS, NIPF FINISH NIPPLE DOWN, SET TA CAP.	PLE DOWN BOPS, SET SLIPS W/162K, . RELEASE RIG AT 18:00 HRS	PROD	PROD	CSG/CEMENT	NIPPLE UP B.O.P./WELLHEAD	